














Invoice

8/22/2016 262

Mountain Accord
Laynee Jones
7258 Racquet Club Dr
Suite 200
Salt Lake City, UT 84121

Houndstooth Tech

PO Box 1369
Oakridge, OR 97463

Net 15

Total

IT Consulting $120/hr Mounted TV's in office space.3 120.00 360.00

$360.00









 



Please Remit To: Invoice No Invoice Date Customer No.

Order No. Order Date Cust. Phone #

SOLD TO: THANK YOU Total Amount Due

Invoice No. Invoice Date

SOLD TO:

Your Order No:

SHIPPED TO:

Shipped Via F.O.B. Shipping Point Date Shipped Terms

Quantity Stock Number Description Unit
Price

Amount State/Zip To

Total:



 



Barber Consultants
1733 South 1300 East #100  Invoice # Billing Period 
Salt Lake City, UT 84105    10 August 2016 
801-487-9631  

Invoice Date Due Date 
 9/6/2016 9/20/2016 

Bill To:  
Laynee Jones  
LJ Consulting  
11337 East Silver Snow Lane  
Salt Lake City, UT 84121  

Re: Mountain Accord Project 

INVOICE FOR: Direct Expenses for Office Furniture and Supplies

Office Space  
     Office Cleaning  Brooke Willits    $199 
     Office Supplies Walmart, Target, 7-Eleven $112 
     Office Furniture  IKEA    $542 
   TOTAL $853 











People + Place, LLC INVOICE
Christie Oostema Brown, AICP, MUP To: LJ Consulting
948 S 800 E Invoice #: 083116
Salt Lake City, Utah 84105 Invoice date: August 31, 2016
801.712.3123 Work completed: August 1-31, 2016

LABOR: Christie Oostema Brown
Date Hours Task Description

17-Aug 2.5 2.5 Transportation - form stakeholder and exec com groups, final report finance 
Total Hours 2.5
Hourly Rate $128

Total Labor Fee $320.00

EXPENSES:
Date Amount Description

8-Aug 26 2 Survey Monkey (monthly subscription)
Total Expenses $26.00

TOTAL INVOICE AMOUNT $346.00
invoice due upon receipt

Contract Amount: $32,000
Current Invoice Amount: $346.00
Prior Invoiced to Date $26,216.68
Total Invoiced to Date: $26,562.68
Contract Amount Remaining: $5,437.32

Work Summary: Transportation stakeholder group development, final report finance review







Mountain Accord Program Management

Hard Costs
Date Task or Work Performed Time Amt Time Amt Time Amt Time Amt Time Amt Total Balance

Strat Leads ($225/hr) Project Mngr ($185/hr) Sr. Support ($145/hr) Admin ($95/hr) Other Support ($45/hr)Creative Mgmt($140/hr) Creative Supp ($115/hrCopywriting ($120/hr)

AUGUST HOURS

Monday, August 01, 2016
Call with Laynee RE land bill, budget, transportation materials and 
commission staffing. 0.25 $46.25 $46.25 $46.25

Monday, August 01, 2016 Internal meeting on land bill and transportation comms planning 0.75 $168.75 0.75 $138.75 $307.50 $353.75

Saturday, August 06, 2016 Email regarding transportation framework; review materials 0.75 $168.75 0.75 $138.75 $307.50 $661.25
Monday, August 08, 2016 Land Bill conference call 0.50 $92.50 $92.50 $753.75
Monday, August 08, 2016 Transportation meeting 1.00 $225.00 1.00 $185.00 $410.00 $1,163.75

Monday, August 08, 2016
Outline land bill public talking points and framework for possible 
congressional testimony 1.25 $281.25 $281.25 $1,445.00

Monday, August 08, 2016 Telephone conference with Bill Simmons 0.50 $112.50 $112.50 $1,557.50
Thursday, August 11, 2016 Land bill meeting 3.00 $555.00 $555.00 $2,112.50

Friday, August 12, 2016 Review transportation related materials sent by Laynee 1.00 $225.00 1.25 $231.25 $456.25 $2,568.75
Friday, August 12, 2016 Emial threads on land bill and commission formation 0.50 $112.50 0.50 $92.50 $205.00 $2,773.75

Saturday, August 13, 2016
Review revised framework information (PPT) and winter plan 
documents 0.50 $112.50 0.75 $138.75 $251.25 $3,025.00

Monday, August 15, 2016 Land bill meeting debrief w/Maura 0.75 $168.75 0.75 $138.75 $307.50 $3,332.50

Monday, August 15, 2016

Questions from Rita Lund and Nancy Carlson Gotts about the 
commission, request to attend ACCT meeting to clarify information 
that seems to be in conflict. 0.50 $92.50 $92.50 $3,425.00

Wednesday, August 17, 2016
Email correspondence with community council chairpersons about 
attendance at their September meetings 0.75 $138.75 $138.75 $3,563.75

Wednesday, August 17, 2016 Land bill-Transportation strategy prep meeting 1.00 $225.00 1.00 $185.00 $410.00 $3,973.75

Thursday, August 18, 2016 Discussion with Alyson Heyrend on land bill and transportation 1.00 $225.00 $225.00 $4,198.75

Wednesday, August 17, 2016
Call from John Knoblock with question about land bill map and 
timeline; email to Megan to verify status 0.75 $138.75 $138.75 $4,337.50

Thursday, August 18, 2016
Email threads between ACCT and Community Council members 
about attending September meetings to give a MA update 1.50 $277.50 $277.50 $4,615.00

Thursday, August 18, 2016 Cottonwood Transportation strategy meeting & follow up 2.50 $562.50 2.50 $462.50 $1,025.00 $5,640.00
Tuesday, August 23, 2016 Transportation meeting, travel, follow up 2.50 $562.50 $562.50 $6,202.50

Friday, August 26, 2016 Commission meeting; travel, follow up, notes 2.00 $450.00 3.75 $693.75 $1,143.75 $7,346.25

Thursday, August 25, 2016
Review notes and materials from Laynee on winter transporation 
plans, draft framework, etc. 0.50 $112.50 0.75 $138.75 $251.25 $7,597.50

Friday, August 26, 2016
Capture contact information from new PB tean members and 
property owners who sent inquiries via the web or email to Laynee 0.25 $46.25 0.50 $46.25 $7,643.75

Tuesday, August 30, 2016
Correspondence with PB/Laynee about content for public 
document on framework 0.50 $92.50 $92.50 $7,736.25

Tuesday, August 30, 2016 Meeting with UTA on possible bus service 1.25 $281.25 1.25 $231.25 $512.50 $8,248.75

Wednesday, August 31, 2016
Correspondence re land bill messaging for radio interviews; 
discussion with Mike Grass. 0.50 $112.50 0.75 $138.75 $251.25 $8,500.00

Wednesday, August 31, 2016 Discussion with Alyson Heyrend on land bill 0.75 $168.75 $168.75 $8,668.75
TOTAL HOURS FOR AUGUST 19.00 23.75 0.50

Total Hours Maura Carabello 19.00
Dina Blaes 23.75

Aimee Baarz 0.50

August 31, 2016





DAN HARTMAN AUGUST 2016 HOURS -- MT. ACCORD PROJECT

DATE HOURS DESCRIPTION
8/1/2016 1.75 LJ mtg on org; TD on lands bill; BS on land bill; RW on Sandy ILA presentation
8/2/2016 1.75 LC on ILA; MA email and time for presentation; BS on Local Agree for legislation; GC update on MtA; 

update ILA legal team on Sandy
8/3/2016 2.00 JC and RW emails Sandy; ST and PR emails re CH IKA presentations; respond ST redline ILA; 

email scheduling GC; call from GC; lunch TD, NC and SF
8/4/2016 3.00 prepare briefing for both ILA Sandy City Council; emails FF; emails JC; emails Council staff; write and   

send two one pagers 
8/6/2016 1.00 GC Calendar, $ ideas, transistion; prep for Sandy presentation ILA
8/8/2016 1.50 Transition conf call; FF ILA for GOED; JH post-mortem
8/9/2016 3.00 Present Sandy City Council work session, ILA presentation; legal re: ILA in packet; TD and JH re: 

appointee to Board
8/10/2016 2.25 ILA appointee; Aug 16 Sandy Council prepare; Aug 15 mtg invitees; agenda 8/26; CR emails and 8/15 

Assignment meeting; KC email re: change Assignment ILA
8/11/2016 1.25 TD re: JC; Organization and 2017 transportation plan; Assignment ILA SLC emails; ST email
8/12/2016 2.50 Sandy City attorney; BS land bill; TD organization; BS Monday call and trigger; JH email trigger; Sandy Council 

MA; JC email date Sandy Council
8/13/2016 0.25 BA and JH email re: transportation
8/15/2016 4.50 FF call re: Summit language request for Assignment ILA; Leg coordinating call; BS call; BB call; MW call; set up 

Metro ED for Congressional tour at treatment plant; prep and meeting time CWC $ ILA Assignment meeting  
Sandy; TD re: audit; FF re: ILA game plan; AG email and response to Draper 

8/16/2016 0.50 FF re: email details Assignment ILA game plan; ST email re: recording and response re: Local Funding 
meeting results; changed Assignment ILA

8/17/2016 2.00 TD and GC re: legislative funding, organization, personnel, DC trip, hearing and testimony, transportation 
trigger, CWC appointment process, leg leadership

8/18/2016 1.00 BS re: DC hearing; MC are: testimony and messaging as per BS
8/18/2016 1.00 GC, TD, SF, RW, JN event
8/21/2016 0.25 DL email re: ILA drafts for council
8/22/2016 2.00 8/26 JH & BS re: Summit County & legislation; TD re: trigger & DC testimony; meeting location & group email; 

CB email re: Assignment Notice info; FF re: procurement, latest Assignment Draft, ByLaws, ZIONS research
8/23/2016 1.75 BS call re: Bishop; FF re: financials, Assign ILA, GOED, RV suggested changes; TD & JH re: Fed'l, Accord, 8/25 

BM mtg and 8/26 mtg re: trans; DL and RV emails; LJ call re: trigger, financials, PB, agenda 8/26     



8/24/2016 2.00 BS email re: media; agenda prep and distribute 8/26/2016; financial info distribute; FF re: Assign ILA 
distribution; procurement draft and discussion 8/26/2016; LJ and VO intro and contact info exchange 

8/25/2016 2.00 Memo and info to VO; BM and TD meeting; organization discussion
8/26/2016 5.75 CWC organizing agendas, meeting prep, meeting, PB discussion; VO/TD meeting setup; BS calls & emails;  

revise Transfer Agreement, email agreement; email list to BS; email list for transfer agreement; review 
notes and action items from CWC meeting; meeting notices

8/27/2016 1.50 emails, Sept 30 org, DL email, 10/21 met org & notices
8/28/2016 1.50 LJ emails, JH emasil, LJ email re: CAO; KC re: CAO; email, VO texts
8/29/2016 1.50 Regular Monday conf call; TD re: CAO; MC re: Comms
8/30/2016 1.50 GC re: $ UT Leg; TD ans VO are: CAO
8/31/2016 1.50 FF re: procurement, CAO and LJ lettter; TD and JH regarding whose decision; TD and BM discussion re: CWC

org; emails and texts
50.50 TOTAL AUGUST HOURS
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Task 14: Funding and Finance

Total Project Amount Current Bill Amount Amount Outstanding Total Amount 
Billed to Date

$35,000.00

Bill Summary

Total Amount Due ................................................................................................ $8,785.00

STATEMENT
































