
 

 

El Prado Getaway Classic 

Mesquite, NV – May 30 – June 1, 2024 

 
Lodging will be at the CasaBlanca Resort and Casino. 
You are responsible for reserving and paying for 
your rooms by calling the hotel at 877-438-2929 and 
using Reservation ID 1EPMC24. Our group rates are 
Wed/Thu $74, Fri/Sat $100, Sun $64; plus 12.5% tax 
and $8.99 resort fee.  

Golf Thursday May 30 at Falcon Ridge 11:00 AM 
Shotgun - Skins game with gross and net skins, 
closests, and single low gross/net. One or two flights 
based on size of field.  

Golf Friday May 31 at Palms 7:00 AM Shotgun  –
Skins game with 2-3 flights of gross and net skins, 
closests; and blind draw partner best ball. 

Golf Saturday June 1 at CasaBlanca 7:00 AM Shotgun 
– Individual Low Net Tournament paying 30% of the 
field, gross skins, closests; and blind draw partner 
best ball. 

Saturday June 1 Awards Dinner at the resort. BBQ 
Dinner Buffet from 6:00 to 9:00 PM. Dinner starts at 
7:00 PM. Dinner is included for golfers. Guests are 
$50 each. 

Guests are welcome to play golf if space is available 
at the deadline. Guests play to their GHIN handicap 
LI. If no GHIN handicap, then they will play to 0 
handicap. Guests will be in on skins, closest, and two-
man blind draw, and Thursday low net/gross; but are 
NOT in on the Saturday ILN tournament. If we have 
enough guests, there will be a separate tournament 
pot for guests on Saturday. 

For golf questions, contact Mark Rief or Gary Abbott 

Payment- The prices on the entry form include Golf, 
Saturday Dinner, and prize money. You are 
responsible for your lodging. Payment must be 
received by March 15th, so that we can guarantee our 
place at all venues. Pay with Zelle, check, or cash. 
However you pay, you still need to fill out this form. 

For payment questions, contact Rich Lizarraga or 
Scott Harlin. 

 

ENTRY FORM 
Required for All golfers 

1. Select your golf package: 
    3-Day Thursday, Friday, and Saturday $ 490 
    2-Day Friday and Saturday only $ 345 
    1-Day Saturday only $ 210 
 
2. Awards Dinner Saturday Night 
   I will attend   Yes No 
   I will bring _______ guests at $50 each =  _____  
 
3. Total Amount                                         $  ________  

 
4. Select your Payment Method 
    Zelle to payment@elpradomensclub.com 
        Account Name   _________________________  

 
    Check payable to El Prado Men’s Club   
    Cash to Scott Harlin or Rich Lizarraga 
 

5. Hand this form (with payment of not Zelle) to 
Scott or Richard, or mail to: 

 El Prado Mens Golf Club 
 6555 Pine Ave 
 Chino, CA 91708 
 

Payment without completing this entry form 
DOES NOT SIGN YOU UP. 

 

Signups will close when the field is full, or March 15, 
whichever comes first. 

 

Name ____________________________________  

Phone ________________ GHIN ______________  

Email  ____________________________________  

Requests:  ____________________________  

https://casablancaresort.com/
https://casablancaresort.com/golf/#falcon-ridge
https://casablancaresort.com/golf/palms/
https://casablancaresort.com/golf/casablanca/
mailto:mark.rief@verizon.net;garwa88@yahoo.com?subject=Getaway%20Golf%20Question
mailto:richardlizarraga@rocketmail.com;scott_harlin12@yahoo.com?subject=Getaway%20Payment%20Question
mailto:richardlizarraga@rocketmail.com;scott_harlin12@yahoo.com?subject=Getaway%20Payment%20Question
https://enroll.zellepay.com/qr-codes?data=eyJuYW1lIjoiRUwgUFJBRE8gTUVOUyBHT0xGIENMVUIiLCJhY3Rpb24iOiJwYXltZW50IiwidG9rZW4iOiJwYXltZW50QGVscHJhZG9tZW5zY2x1Yi5jb20ifQ==

