AGENDA

DATE: April 22, 2024 3:00 PM
Roll Call:  Frank Puskar
Alyn Hutter
Duane E. Hutter
Flag Pledge.
Public Notice:

Public comments on agenda items.

Motion to approve previous months minutes.

Motion to pay all approved bills from General Fund.

Motion to distribute the 2024 Fire Tax to the five fire departments in the amount of $20,000.00
per department.

Motion to award material bids for 2024-2025.

s+ Bids Received April 2024-April 2025********
Company Top Top Binder Binder
T =il -d =z =k w % &  _F T Antiskid#
| B - 9.5mm 0-0.3 9.5mm0.3-3  19.0 mm 0-0.3 19.0 mm0.3-3 Cold patch Cold patch CRS-2 #8 Stone 2RC #57 Stone  #67 Stone  #3 Stone 2 Crushed
) - FOB Plant/DEL__ FOB PlantDEL__ FOB PlanyDEL__ FOB PlanUDEL  FOB Plant D d Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered  Dellvered  Delivered  FOBIDEL _
Heidelberg-Hanson Aggregates  72.00/84.00  72.00/84.00 = 62.08/7400  6200/7400  nobid nobid  nobid 46.96Del | 17.71Del 24.46 Dal  24.460el 2446 Del _ nobid
New Enterprise Stone & Lime © _ 76.49/85.59  76.49/85.59 | 70.77/7987  70.77/79.87 — nobid . nobid nobid 27.45/34.60 7.50(14.85 13.95/21.10 [13.95/21,10 1450/21.65 22.50/40.75
TrescoPaving 71.00/81.00  71.00/81.00 _ 65.00/7500  65.00/75.00  nobid no bid nobid  nobid no bid no bid nobid ~ nebid  nobid
Ligonier Stone & Lime ~ nobid na hid | nobid nobid nobid | nobid na bid no bid nobid  nobid  nobid  nobid  16.55/2548
in Stone & Lime, LLC "no bid no bid _no bid nobid  nobid no bid no bid 11.00/16.25 16.00/21.25 17.00/22.25 16.26/21.50 _ nobid
|Amerikohl Aggregates, Inc. no bid no bid no bid ~no bid nobid | nobid _ nobid |3400Del 19.00Del 2200 0el 2200 Del  22.00 Del _ no bid
HEFWAY, LLC (CostarsBid)  nobid nobid  nobid nobid  Castars Costars no bid nobid ~ nobid _ nobid nobid ~ nobid  nobid
|Russell Standard Corporation no bid no bid no bid ~_nobid | nobid | nobid 2470 nobid _ nobid nobid  nobid  nobid  nobid
Midiand Asphalt Materials — nobid ~nobid  nobid nobid  nobid nobid 2410 nobid nobid  nobid  nobid  nobid  nobid
Note: Hanson: Connellsville Gnly o R R R DR | AR R s e e e

Public Comments:

Motion to adjourn.

Public Attendance:




