

The Robbins Firm

999 Peachtree Street, N.E.
Suite 1120
Atlanta, GA 30309

Statement as of April 30, 2015
Statement No. 10384

Detroit Memorial Partners

Matter

26504.0002: Receiver

Current Billing	Previous Balance
47,698.44	0.00
<hr/> 47,698.44	<hr/> 0.00
Total Now Due:	<hr/>47,698.44

The Robbins Firm

999 Peachtree Street, N.E.
Suite 1120
Atlanta, GA 30309

Statement as of April 30, 2015
Statement No. 10384

Detroit Memorial Partners

26504.0002: Receiver

Professional Fees	Task	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
Ca00					
1/5/2015	JA	Case Review and respond to correspondence (.6) review proof of claim forms (.5)	1.20	350.00	420.00
1/6/2015	MP	Case Prepare DMP fee application (.2); review email from A. Shipper (.1)	0.30	275.00	82.50
1/7/2015	JA	Case Research into MMG financial questions	0.50	350.00	175.00
1/9/2015	JA	Case Correspondence with court, Shippers, MMG (.5); further work on website (1.2)	1.70	350.00	595.00
1/12/2015	TA	Case Text message reply to Amy Preston (DMP Claimant) regarding problems with DMP Receivership website.	0.30	90.00	27.00
1/12/2015	JA	Case Various correspondence (MMG, Shippers, noteholders)	0.40	350.00	140.00
1/14/2015	JA	Case Review of filing	0.90	350.00	315.00
1/15/2015	TA	Case Assist M. Parrish with Receiver Fee Applicaiton.	0.50	90.00	45.00
1/15/2015	JA	Case Reviewing and researching potential investment opportunities for MMG and making suggestions to MMG regarding investments	2.80	350.00	980.00
1/15/2015	MP	Case Review correspondence from WMG regarding MMG investments	0.60	275.00	165.00
1/16/2015	JA	Case Review of order (4.); review of information provided by Alleca (.4); researching other potential claimants which Alleca could have information (.5)	1.30	350.00	455.00
1/16/2015	MP	Case Review order granting capital call from court (.1); analyze correspondence regarding accounting numbers (.1)	0.20	275.00	55.00
1/20/2015	MP	Case Call with Jordan Dorrestein	0.30	275.00	82.50
1/21/2015	JA	Case Review of offer; (.8) meeting with counsel on next steps/strategy (.8)	1.60	350.00	560.00
1/21/2015	MP	Case Evaluate offer	0.70	275.00	192.50

1/21/2015	RLR	Case	Review MMG proposal (.4); communications with Board (.5)	0.90	395.00	355.50
1/22/2015	JA	Case	Call with Michael Blake regarding offer (.3); gathering and sending information for Michael Blake so he can advise on the offer (.9); review of more proof of claim forms, particular for Alleca related funds and "equity" holders in DMP (3.5); letter to Bob Terry (1.2); review and revision to quarterly report (.4)	6.30	350.00	2,205.00
1/22/2015	MP	Case	Analyze offer for 49% (1.0); review draft correspondence from Receiver (1.0)	2.00	275.00	550.00
1/23/2015	JA	Case	Continuing work on evaluating proof of claim forms (1.9); focusing on noteholders with potential issues on their proof of claim forms and reviewing backup documents to compare our information with information provided by noteholders (1.9; reviewing pleadings in related DMP case (2.0)	5.80	350.00	2,030.00
1/23/2015	MP	Case	Analyze issues related to claims by Summit Receiver	0.70	275.00	192.50
1/26/2015	JA	Case	Continuing review of proof of claim forms	1.50	350.00	525.00
1/27/2015	JA	Case	Continuing to review certain proof of claim forms and back up data and comparing it our information, including in particular focusing on 2008 payments from DMP to claimants (4.1); call with MMG (.5); call with L. Anspach (.3)	4.90	350.00	1,715.00
1/27/2015	MP	Case	Analysis of claim forms (.8); correspondence with L. Anspach (.4); plan claim form response process (.4)	1.60	275.00	440.00
1/28/2015	JA	Case	Continuing work on proof of claim issues/forms and updating related spreadsheet	3.80	350.00	1,330.00
1/29/2015	JA	Case	Finishing initial assessment of proof of claim forms	4.80	350.00	1,680.00
1/29/2015	MP	Case	Claim form analysis	1.00	275.00	275.00
2/2/2015	MP	Case	Analysis of sale of 49% (.1); review correspondence from Arnall Golden Gregory (.2)	0.30	275.00	82.50
2/3/2015	JA	Case	Call with SEC (.8); call with Michael Blake on valuation issues (.5); review of correspondence from noteholder counsel and research of related issues (2.0)	3.30	350.00	1,155.00
2/4/2015	JA	Case	Research and review of case law on judgment priority issue (3.1) and writing response to claimant's counsel on the issue (1.2)	4.30	350.00	1,505.00
2/4/2015	MP	Case	Review research regarding priority of judgment over other creditors in receivership (1.0); review correspondence regarding Leonard Walter claim (.3)	1.30	275.00	357.50

2/5/2015	JA	Case	Call with MMG (.4); call with Bob Terry (1.0)	1.40	350.00	490.00
2/5/2015	MP	Case	Review correspondence from court and from D. Shipper	0.40	275.00	110.00
2/10/2015	JA	Case	Review of valuation and calculating value	1.40	350.00	490.00
2/10/2015	MP	Case	Call with Bill Billimoria	0.20	275.00	55.00
2/11/2015	JA	Case	Drafting correspondence to a claimant counsel	1.70	350.00	595.00
2/11/2015	MP	Case	Review correspondence with Habib Arogeti (.2); review and comment on correspondence with counsel for Leonard Walter(.8); analyze Walter's claims; review correspondence from Bob Terry (.2)	1.20	275.00	330.00
2/12/2015	JA	Case	Review of revised valuation	0.40	350.00	140.00
2/12/2015	MP	Case	Review comments from Summit Receiver and correspondence to Arnall Golden Gregory; review analysis from Habib Arogeti	0.70	275.00	192.50
2/13/2015	JA	Case	Review of latest prospective purchaser offer (.4); valuation issues (.8); discussion regarding same (.2)	1.40	350.00	490.00
2/13/2015	MP	Case	Review correspondence with Habib Arogeti and analyze financial data	0.50	275.00	137.50
2/16/2015	JA	Case	Meeting regarding strategy on sale of MMG interest and correspondence with MMG and call with MMG and follow up after call (1.8); review of filing (.4)	2.20	350.00	770.00
2/16/2015	MP	Case	Call with MMG board members (.5); review correspondence with L. Anspach and members (.5)	1.00	275.00	275.00
2/17/2015	JA	Case	Working on potential deal and communications with L. Anspach and M. Parrish regarding same and reviewing related correspondence	0.40	350.00	140.00
2/17/2015	MP	Case	Analyze issues with offers for DMP interest in MMG	0.90	275.00	247.50
2/18/2015	JA	Case	Working on potential sale of MMG interest including calls with MMG and the broker and review of related documents/correspondence	3.50	350.00	1,225.00
2/18/2015	MP	Case	Review correspondence regarding sale of 49% (.2); correspondence with MKSH (.3); conference call with MMG board members (.4)	0.90	275.00	247.50
2/19/2015	JA	Case	Revamping DMP website and adding content (4.5); meeting with equity member (.8); call with equity member (.5); review of financial information (.5)	6.30	350.00	2,205.00
2/19/2015	MP	Case	Meet with Steve Kester (1.7); call with Chris Lyon (.3); call with D. Shipper (.2)	2.20	275.00	605.00
2/20/2015	JA	Case	Call with WMG (.2); strategy on next steps regarding offers (.3)	0.50	350.00	175.00

2/20/2015	MP	Case	Call with Kathy Davis (.2); call with MMG board members (.3)	1.30	275.00	357.50
2/23/2015	JA	Case	Researching case law on stock/asset sale issue, starting with DE and then expanding to all jurisdictions (4.1); call with WMG regarding next steps on sale (.9); communication with broker regarding same (.3)	5.30	350.00	1,855.00
2/23/2015	MP	Case	Call with WMG	0.80	275.00	220.00
2/24/2015	JA	Case	Working on sale of interest and related issues	0.80	350.00	280.00
2/25/2015	JA	Case	Multiple communications/calls related to potential deal including with counsel for prospective purchaser and equity holders in DMP	3.50	350.00	1,225.00
2/25/2015	MP	Case	Prepare for call with DMP members	1.30	275.00	357.50
2/26/2015	JA	Case	Working on ongoing issues regarding DMP and MMG (1.4); related calls (1.5)	2.90	350.00	1,015.00
2/26/2015	MP	Case	Confer regarding sale of 49% interest (.2); call with members (.6)	1.10	275.00	302.50
2/27/2015	JA	Case	Continuing work on MMG/DMP issues (1.2); adding members to MMG board (1.2)	2.40	350.00	840.00
2/27/2015	MP	Case	Review tax issue with Michigan Dept. of Revenue; call with DMP Board memers	1.30	275.00	357.50
3/1/2015	JA	Case	Conference call and email to MMG regarding financial situation	1.20	350.00	420.00
3/1/2015	MP	Case	Participate on conference call with DMP board members	0.50	275.00	137.50
3/4/2015	JA	Case	Call with Keenan B., Doug T., and Steve K.	1.00	350.00	350.00
3/5/2015	JA	Case	Communications regarding capital call issue (.2); review of related correspondence (.3)	0.50	350.00	175.00
3/5/2015	MP	Case	Review correspondence regarding capital call	0.50	275.00	137.50
3/6/2015	MP	Case	Call attorney for Sean Haney (.3); review correspondence with DMP members (.5)	0.80	275.00	220.00
3/9/2015	MP	Case	Review MKSH engagement letter and compare with terms from last year (.2); correspondence with members regarding sale of 49% (.2)	0.40	275.00	110.00
3/10/2015	JA	Case	Call with MMG	1.00	350.00	350.00
3/10/2015	MP	Case	Call regarding proposal	0.60	275.00	165.00
3/11/2015	JA	Case	Correspondence regarding strategy	1.00	350.00	350.00
3/12/2015	JA	Case	Call and other correspondence	1.50	350.00	525.00
3/15/2015	MP	Case	Review MMG sales report	0.20	275.00	55.00
3/16/2015	MP	Case	Call with counsel for Sean Heaney	0.20	275.00	55.00
3/17/2015	JA	Case	Review of variety of correspondence and call with MMG	0.50	350.00	175.00
3/19/2015	JA	Case	Call with potential bidder and related follow up	1.20	350.00	420.00

3/19/2015	MP	Case	Conference call	0.40	275.00	110.00
3/20/2015	JA	Case	Call regarding next steps	1.00	350.00	350.00
3/20/2015	MP	Case	Correspondence with members regarding DMP issues and conference call with members.	1.10	275.00	302.50
3/22/2015	MP	Case	Review email from David Shipper	0.40	275.00	110.00
3/25/2015	JA	Case	Working on variety of items/issues, including regarding prospective offers, calls regarding same including with DMP equity members and prospective purchaser	2.50	350.00	875.00
3/25/2015	MP	Case	Participate in conference call with DMP members (1.8); call with S. Kester (.3); call Arvind Kotak (.3)	1.40	275.00	385.00
3/25/2015	RLR	Case	Review proposals, financing; conference with counsel	0.70	395.00	276.50
3/26/2015	JA	Case	Follow up communications on issues involving prospective purchaser bid and capital call	1.50	350.00	525.00
3/26/2015	MP	Case	Call with DMP members	1.20	275.00	330.00
3/27/2015	JA	Case	Continued work on same issues (prospective purchaser etc.)	0.80	350.00	280.00
3/29/2015	JA	Case	Meeting with R. Robbins regarding next steps	0.50	350.00	175.00
3/29/2015	RLR	Case	Review proposal; review Board duties	1.30	395.00	513.50
3/30/2015	JA	Case	Post MMG Board meeting communications and final determination regarding capital call and communications regarding same	1.20	350.00	420.00
3/30/2015	MP	Case	Conference call regarding board issues (.4); call with Larry Anspach (.3)	0.70	275.00	192.50
3/30/2015	RLR	Case	Prepare for and attend Board conference call	3.30	395.00	1,303.50
3/31/2015	JA	Case	Evaluation of offer and communications with DMP equity members regarding same and communication with WMG/MMG (2.3); review of motion (.2)	2.50	350.00	875.00
3/31/2015	MP	Case	Email to Mark Morrow regarding captial call (1.1); draft motion to participate in capital call (.8); call with WMG members (.8); review offer for 49% interest (2.0); call with DMP Board members to discuss asset purchase offer (1.0)	5.70	275.00	1,567.50
3/31/2015	RLR	Case	Conference regarding offer	0.90	395.00	355.50
				<u>141.90</u>		<u>47,009.00</u>
St00						
1/5/2015	MP	Status	Prepare DMP quarterly fee application.(NO CHARGE)	2.60	275.00	715.00
1/13/2015	MP	Status	Prepare quarterly fee application. (NO CHARGE)	3.20	275.00	880.00

1/14/2015	MP	Status	Prepare receiver's fee application. (NO CHARGE)	3.00	275.00	825.00
1/15/2015	MP	Status	Prepare fee application for service on SEC and DMP members. (NO CHARGE)	0.30	275.00	82.50
1/16/2015	MP	Status	Review and serve Receiver's proposed fee application. (NO CHARGE)	1.00	275.00	275.00
1/20/2015	MP	Status	Prepare Receiver's quarterly status report	1.30	275.00	357.50
1/21/2015	MP	Status	Review Receiver's Quarterly Status Report	0.70	275.00	192.50
1/30/2015	MP	Status	File DMP quarterly report	0.10	275.00	27.50
2/16/2015	MP	Status	Finalize and file Receiver's Fee Application.(NO CHARGE)	1.80	275.00	495.00
				14.00		3,850.00

Sub-total Fees: 50,859.00

Discount: Fee application prep time -3,272.50

Rate Summary

Tenitra Adams	0.80hours at \$ 90.00/hr	72.00
Jason Alloy	97.10hours at \$ 350.00/hr	33,985.00
Matthew Parrish	50.90hours at \$ 275.00/hr	13,997.50
Richard L Robbins	7.10hours at \$ 395.00/hr	2,804.50
Total hours:	155.90	

Expenses

			Units	Price	Amount
1/11/2015	Case	Miscellaneous - 2 GoDaddy website buliders at \$9.99 - J.Alloy	1.00	19.98	19.98
1/20/2015	Case	FedEx Charges	1.00	28.84	28.84
2/11/2015	Case	Miscellaneous - Website Builder - GoDaddy - J.Alloy	1.00	14.98	14.98
2/12/2015	Case	Miscellaneous - Domains - GoDaddy - JAlloy	1.00	48.14	48.14
				Sub-total Expenses:	111.94

Payments

2/18/2015	Payment	Pymt CK 2510 - Receivers Account -	31,671.27
			Sub-total Payments: 31,671.27

Total Current Billing:	47,698.44
Previous Balance Due:	31,671.27
Payments Received:	31,671.27
Total Now Due:	47,698.44