
REGULAR MEETING 
 

AUGUST 9, 2010 
 

The Board of Trustees held the Regular Meeting of August 9, 2010 at the 
Village Municipal Building, 167 North Main Street, Liberty New York. 

Mayor Winters opened the meeting with the Pledge of Allegiance. 
        

PRESENT: Mayor Richard Winters, Trustee Shirley Lindsley and Trustee Joan 

Stoddard.  Also Present: Langdon Chapman, Attorney for the Village and 
Judy Zurawski, Clerk/Treasurer. 

 

ABSENT:    Trustee Corinne McGuire and Trustee Luis Alvarez 
 

ALSO          Peter Ehrenberg, Fred Glazer, Jeff Glazer, Daniel Ratner, David Burke,   
PRESENT:  Michael Vanyo, Elizabeth Montag, Michael Houghtaling, Jose Rubio, Julia 

Stuhmiller, Rose Hewlett, Henrietta Phelps and Danny Curry.                    
 

APPROVALMotion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and    

OF          unanimously carried approving the following minutes: 
MINUTES:  

PUBLIC HEARING – JULY 8, 2010 RE: C.D.B.G. GRANT 

 
Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried approving the following minutes: 

 
 PUBLIC HEARING – JULY 12, 2010  RE: C.D.B.G. GRANT          

 
Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried approving the following minutes: 

 
 PUBLIC HEARING – JULY 12, 2010  RE: LOCAL LAW #2-2010 

 
 Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
 unanimously carried approving the following minutes: 

 
 PUBLIC HEARING – JULY 12, 2010  RE: LOCAL LAW #3-2010 
 

Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried approving the following minutes: 

 
 REGULAR MEETING – JULY 12, 2010   
 

CORRES-     Mayor Winters said the Village has received and sent the following              
PONDENCE: correspondence and it is available for review in the Clerk’s Office: 
                       

  INCOMING 



- Letter from Peter Ehrenberg Re: Revenue 8/2/2010 
- Various Reports and Letters from Delaware Engineering 08/2010 

- Letter from SC Planning Re: Water Tank 8/6/10 
- Letter from SC Planning Re: WWTP 8/6/2010 

 
OUTGOING 
- Letter to Root 52 Gallery Re:  Landscaping 8/2/2010 

- Letter to Town and Country Antiques LLC Re: Landscaping 7/20/2010 
- Letter to Harris Funeral Home Re: Landscaping 8/2/2010 
- Letter to Etta/Gene Barbanti Re: Landscaping 7/20/2010 

- Letter to Sam’s Service Re: Landscaping 7/20/2010 
- Letter to Floyd and BoBo Re: Landscaping 7/20/2010 

   
PUBLIC Mayor Winters opened the meeting to comments from the Public.  
COMMENTS: 

Rose Marie Hewlett 

 
Rose Marie Hewlett (Village Resident) said she would like to see all of Main 

Street designated as a Drug Free Zone, especially around the school. 
 

The Board said they would look into the process of how it could be 
accomplished.   

 

Henrich Strauch – Liberty CDC  
 
Henrich said he had a matter for Executive Session regarding CDBG Loans.   

 

Peter Ehrenberg – Discussion of Proposal  

 
Peter Ehrenberg (Village Resident) explained to the Board that he is 
currently enrolled in the Green Building Maintenance and Management 

Degree at Sullivan County Community College.  He said he has two years of 
work experience in the renewable energy field and that his ultimate 
education goal is to become a Civil Engineer and Real Estate Developer. 

 
He said he would like to act as a free agent consultant to the Village and try 

to come up with proposals that would generate higher revenue and possibly 
create jobs.  He said he has some ideas for the Water Works site. 
 

The Board thought it was an excellent idea. 
 

Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried to have Peter Ehrenberg as a designated volunteer in 
the Village.   

 
The Board asked Judy Zurawski to check with the insurance company to 
make sure there is coverage.           



 

Julia Stumiller, Fred Glazer and Jeff Glazer  – Dead End Sign 

 
Julia, Fred and Jeff discussed the bike and walking trail off of State Street 
and the fact that it is now closed off to vehicular traffic.  Their concerns 

ranged from landlocked property, fuel oil deliveries, lessened police presence 
and barricades they consider to be an eyesore.    
   
The Board explained that this portion of the former railroad bed is not a 
maintained road by the Village of Liberty. 

 
Mayor Winters did explain that the barricades are going to be moved to the 
Chestnut Street side of the walking trail and will be replaced by guard rails. 
 
Trustee Stoddard said that the board would speak to the Police Department 

regarding their patrols in that area. 

 

David Burke and Michael Vanyo (Liberty Central School) 

 
David Burke (School Board President) and Michael Vanyo (Superintendent 
of Liberty School said they came to the meeting to share information 

regarding the renovations currently being done at the Liberty Central 
School. 

 
David Burke said the main source of concern is the meter pit that is being 
installed to bring water into the school.  The concern is that the school is 

looking to hook a four-inch line into the Village’s eight-inch line by 
downsizing at various intervals from eight inches to four inches and then 

going back into a six-inch line. He explained that this is being done in 
accordance to AWWA standards. 
 

Mayor Winters said besides the School engineers and the Village engineers 
having a difference of opinion there have been several letters written, 
including the Fire Chief, expressing water pressure concerns.  Mayor 

Winters said to get readings the lines need to be hooked up and a flow test 
completed.  

 
Trustee Stoddard said the best way to resolve the issue is to set up a 
meeting, within the next day, between the Village Engineers and the School 

Engineers to discuss and resolve this matter. Mayor Winters and the Board 
as well as David Burke and Michael Vanyo said they would also make 
themselves available for the meeting. 

     

 

 

 



Daniel Ratner     
 

Daniel Ratner (Village Resident) expressed his concerns over the school 
water issues. 

 
Daniel Ratner provided the Board with some samples of water and sewer 
installation forms used by other towns and villages.  He said it is very 

important to have the 1-800-DIG number on each form. 
   

ATTORNEY Attorney Chapman said his matter was for Executive Session.      

COMMENTS:  
            

TREAS.      Treasurer Zurawski said the Engineering Report for the water tank was        
REPORT:    ready to be reviewed by the Village Attorney and she provided him a copy.  
                    

TABLED     UPDATE ON ADA COMPLIANCE  
BUSINESS:   

Henrich Strauch said he has made two phone calls to TK Construction and 

has no received no response. 
 

CONSIDER VOTE ON REVONAH HILL WATER TANK – DELAWARE 
ENGINEERING P.C. CONRACT 
 

Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried authorizing Mayor Winters to execute the Engineering 

Agreement with Delaware Engineering P.C. for the Revonah Hill Water 
Storage Tank dated July 9, 2010 subject to review by the Village Attorney. 
 

UPDATE ON GREEN LANE SEWER ISSUE 
 
Mayor Winters said the next step in this matter is to have N.Y.S.E.G. 

complete their pumps.  He said he stopped into NYSEG this morning and 
discussed the matter with John Akins.  He explained to Mayor Winters that 

N.Y.S.E.G. has to change their pole and it will be done very soon. He said 
that until N.Y.S.E.G. completes this process, the diesel pumps are still 
running. 

 
NEW CONSIDER PROPOSED LOCAL LAW #2-2010 RE: ZONING AMENDMENT  

BUSINESS:  
Motion by Trustee Lindsley, seconded by Trustee Stoddard and 
unanimously carried approving local law #2-2010 amending the Zoning Law 

of the Code of the Village of Liberty.  This amendment modifies the side and 
rear set backs.  This local law was put to a vote, which resulted as follows: 
 

 MAYOR WINTERS  - YES 
 TRUSTEE ALVAREZ - ABSENT 

 TRUSTEE LINDSLEY - YES    ADOPTED 
 TRUSTEE MCGUIRE - ABSENT 



        TRUSTEE STODDARD    -         YES 

 
CONSIDER PROPOSED LOCAL LAW #3-2010 RE: FIRE LANE TICKETS 
 

Motion by Trustee Lindsley, seconded by Trustee Stoddard and 
unanimously carried approving local law #3-2010 to amend Chapter 80 of 
the Code of the Village of Liberty.  This proposal law is law to regulate the 

movement in front of, parking, standing or stopping in front of the following 
buildings: 
 

Liberty Square Mall – 187 Mill Street – Tax Map #115-2-6 
Shoprite Mall – 1939 State Route 52 – Tax Map #131-1-1 
Great American – 261 North Main Street – Tax Map #108-6-38  

Liberty Diner – Sullivan Avenue – Tax Map #121-1-8 
Liberty (Sears) Shopping Mall – Sullivan Avenue – Tax Map #121-3-9 
Achieve Rehab and Nursing Facility – Lake Street – Tax Map #117-2-21  
  

This local law was put to a vote, which resulted as follows: 
 
 MAYOR WINTERS  - YES 

 TRUSTEE ALVAREZ - ABSENT 
 TRUSTEE LINDSLEY - YES    ADOPTED 
 TRUSTEE MCGUIRE - ABSENT 

        TRUSTEE STODDARD    -         YES 
 

CONSIDER APPROVAL OF CHEMICAL BIDS FOR WATER DEPARTMENT    
 
 Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 

unanimously carried approving the following bids for the yearly supply of 
Chemicals for the Water Treatment Facility: 

 
 Chlorine Gas  Slack Chemical Co. $87.94/Cylinder 
    54-105CY  Croydon, PA  150 pd/cyl. 

 
 Polyalum. Hycl.  Holland Company .259 per wet pd 
    PAC    Adams, MA   1,000 gal min. 

 
 Hydrated Lime  Slack Chemical Co. 7.89 bag 

     Carthage, NY  50 lb bag 
 
 Soda Ash   Slack Chemical  13.89/bag 

     Carthage, NY  50 lb bag 
 
 Ortho-Poly   Carus Phosphates .61/pd 

 Phosphate Blend  Belmont, NC  55 gal drum 
 

 Polymer Powder  Slack Chemical Co. 119.00 bag/ 
     Carthage, NY  50 pd bag 
 



 Potassium   Slack Chemical  3.21 pd/ 
  Permanganate            Carthage, NY               Min 12 pails   

 
 Sodium     Slack Chemical Co. 1.34/gal 

   Hydochlorite  Carthage, NY               55 gal drum         
 

 All bids received were as follows: 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

                            

 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 

CONSIDER APPROVAL OF CHEMICAL BIDS FOR WASTE WATER 
TREATMENT PLANT 

 

 Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried approving the following bids for a yearly supply of 
chemicals at the Wastewater Treatment Plant: 

 
 Polymer  - Clean Waters Inc.   $2.05/per pd 

    Baltimore, MD   50 pd bags    
 
 Liquid Ferrous  - Slack Chemical Co.                 .747/gallon 

  Sulfate   Glenville, NY   4,000 gal. Min. 
 

 Hydrated Lime - Slack Chemical Co.  13.89 bag 
    Carthage, NY   56 bag pallet 



 
 All bids received were as follows:  

    

NAME & 
ADDRESS LIQUID FERROUS SULFATE 

HYDRATED 
LIME/SODA ASH POLYMER 

   
 
  

Coyne 
Chemical  No Bid No Bid $120.95/5#bag 

3015 State 
Road    Min 150 bags/del  Zetag 7587 

Croydon, PA 
19021     Min 72 bags 

        

        

Thatcher Co. 
of NY .78/gal 16.00/50#bag   

P.O. Box 118 4000 gal min del  Min 2,500 pds  No Bid 

Williamson, 
NY 14589       

        

       

Clean Waters No bid No bid 2.05/pd 

26808 County 
Rt 3       

Plessis, NY 
13675       

        

Jacksson     1.90/pd 

Chemical 
Corp No bid No bid 55# bags 

P.O. Box 606     Polymer 

Livingston, NJ 
07039     Superfloc N300 

    

Custom Env No Bid No Bid 2.72/per pd 

Tech   3000 pds min 

8 Iron Bridge 
Drive   Zeta Lyte 21 

Collegville, PA    

19426    

    

    

Slack 
Chemical Co. .747/gallon 13.89/per 50 bag No Bid 

465 S. Clinton 
Street 4,000 gall min 56 bag pallet  

PO Box 30      

Carthage. NY  
13619      

 
 

  



 WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT – CONSIDER FLOW METER BID 
 

 Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried approving the bid of $65.00/hour, .40/mile, from PID 

Controls, LLC of Glenwood, NJ for the yearly calibration, repair and 
maintenance of flow meters at the Wastewater Treatment Plant.  The 
mileage charge is from Middletown, New York. 

 
 All bids received are as follows: 
  

 PID Controls LLC   $65.00/hour 
 PO Box 180    $.40/mile 

Glenwood, NJ  07418               from Middletown, NY 
 
WASTE WATER TREATMENT PLANT –CONSIDER BID RESULTS UV 

BULBS 
 

 Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried approving the bid of $23.80/per lamp for a total of 130 
lamps ($3,094.00) from Innovative Arc Tubes of Bridgeport, CT 06607. 

 
 All bids received are as follows: 
  

 Innovative Arc Tubes  $23.80 per lamp 
 1240 Central Avenue  for a total of 130 lamps - 

Bridgeport, CT 06607                      $3.094.00 
 
CONSIDER CHANGING DATE OF OCTOBER BOARD MEETING 

(SCHEDULED FOR COLUMBUS DAY) 
 
Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 

unanimously carried to change Octobers Regular Board Meeting to Tuesday, 
October 12th (2010) at 7:00 p.m. due to the Columbus Day Holiday on 

October 11th. 
 
DISCUSSION OF E-MAIL FROM STATE TROOPERS RE: LEASE ON 

LIBERTY BARRACKS 
 

Trustee Stoddard said according to the contract there is a $1.00 buyout 
once the lease payments are finished.  She said the Village should wait to 
see if the State wants to stay in the building and pay the buyout.  

 
CONSIDER RESOLUTION AND PUBLIC NOTICE OF USDA RD PRE-
DEVELOPMENT PLANNING GRANT/WATER STORAGE TANK 

 

Consider Approval of Resolution  

 



 
RESOL.#    Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and   

32-2010:    unanimously carried approving Resolution #32-2010. 
 

         A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE RECEIPT, USE AND DISBURSEMENT  

       OF THE GRANT FUNDS AND AUTHORIZING MAYOR RICHARD WINTERS 

       TO EXECUTE DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO THE USDA RD PRE- 

       DEVELOPMENT PLANNING GRANT.           

 

WHEREAS, the Village of Liberty’s water tank needs to be replaced in a cost 

effective and energy efficient way. SEQR environmental review needs to be 
executed in conjunction with the replacement;  and 
 

WHEREAS, Delaware Engineering, P.C. has been hired to perform the 

evaluation of the current water tank site, compile a Preliminary Engineering 

Report with recommendations for construction and conduct a SEQR review.  
Corresponding work will cost a total of $26,000; and 
 

WHEREAS, the USDA Rural Development is offering a Pre-Development 

Planning grant for municipalities which will cover half of the total cost.  
 

Mayor Richard Winters will be responsible for the transfer of grant funds, 
 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Village of Liberty in Regular 

Meeting convened, petitions Mayor Winters as follows: 
 

Petition 1.  This motion sanctions Mayor Richard Winters to authorize the 

receipt, use and disbursement of the grant funds and authorizes the Mayor 
to execute documents pertaining to the USDA RD Pre-Development 

Planning Grant. 
 

Petition 2.  This resolution shall take effect immediately. 

 

Approval of Notice of Intent – WWTP 

 
Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried approving the Public Notice – Intent to File an 

Application with the USDA Rural Development, Rural Utilities Services.  The 
notice will read as follows: 

 
The Village of Liberty, Sullivan County, New York intends to file an 
application for funding consideration with the USDA, Rural Development.  

Funding will be used for the evaluation and design of a new water tank and 
corresponding SEQRA Environmental Review.  The Water system services a 
total of 1644 private residences and businesses located in the Village of 



Liberty.  The new tank will be located in close proximity to the current tan, 
on Verona Hill Road.  Topographic and geotechnical surveying will be 

performed on the site.  The Preliminary Engineering Report and SEQR 
review for the water tank will cost a total of $26,000.  The Village is 

requesting $13,000 in funding. 
 

TRUSTEE    Mayor Winters opened the meeting to comments from the Board.   

 REPORTS:  
Trustee Stoddard spoke on the following issues: 
 

 Said she would sign off on the manual water bill adjustments if the 
Board would like her to. 

 
Mayor Winters thanked her for volunteering. 

 

 Congratulated everyone on the Sullivan Renaissance win - $8500 in 
awards for most improved community. 

 
 Said that she and Judy Zurawski were going to write a policy regarding 

comp time so that all the office workers follow the same policy.  

 
Trustee Lindsey discussed the sidewalk money and the fact that the worst 
part on North Main Street was from NV Health at 184 North Main Street to 

St. Peters Church at 264 North Main Street. 
 

Mayor Winters said his biggest issue right now is resolving the water issue 
with the Liberty Central School.       

 

APPROVALMotion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and unanimously  
OF BILLS   carried approving Voucher #10-196 to Voucher #10-295 in the amount of   
FOR PYMT $211,342.92. 

 

Post Audit Vouchers 

 
Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 
unanimously carried approving Post Audit Voucher #10-191 to Voucher 

#10-195 in the amount of $249,154.68. 
 

EXECUTIVE Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and 

SESSION:  unanimously carried to go into Executive Session at 9:07 p.m. to discuss  
                  an employment issue in the DPW, litigation regarding CDBG Loans and the  

                  PBA Contract. 
. 

Motion by Trustee Lindsley, seconded by Trustee Stoddard and 

unanimously carried to come out of Executive Session at 9:30 p.m. 
 

 



AJOURN: Motion by Trustee Stoddard, seconded by Trustee Lindsley and unanimously 
carried to adjourn the meeting. 

 
THE MEETING WAS ADJOURNED AT  9:31 P.M. 

 
   RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED, 
 

 
   JUDY ZURAWSKI, CLERK/TREASURER 

   

 


