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National Poetry Month

Is reading poetry a blessing or curse?

Parenting expert offers advice

Reading books vs. social media
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    “Writing a poem is a kind of
possible love affair between
something like the heart (that
outrageous but also shy factory
of emotion) and the learned skills
of the conscious mind. Or, they
make appointments with each
other but are casual and often
fail to keep them…” - Mary
Oliver, winner of the Pulitzer
Prize and National Book Award

“In poetry, there are no casual
readers.” - Theodore Roethke,
poet, teacher, Pulitzer Prize win-
ner

By David R. Altman
Books & Writers Editor

    According to The Poetry
Foundation’s survey of 1,000
Americans, breaking them into
two groups, those that currently
read poetry and those that don’t
- less than five percent of us
could recall either a favorite
poem or a favorite poet.
    What about these famous
lines:  “No man is an island” or
“Do not go gentle into that good
night” or “Two roads diverged in
a yellow wood.” I’m sure those
sound familiar, but many of us
don’t remember who wrote them
(here’s a hint: John Donne,
Dylan Thomas and Robert
Frost). “Oh, yes, that’s right!” I
can hear many of you saying.
    What about your favorite
poets? Most of us grew up read-
ing or listening to the poems of
Robert Frost or Emily Dickinson
or Edgar Allen Poe, or perhaps
Rudyard Kipling or Walt Whit-
man. Those are some of the
greatest poets of the 19th and
20th centuries and they were
often “required” reading.
    But what about modern-day
poets? How many of us have
read the beautifully simple po-
etry of the great Nebraska poet
Ted Kooser or the memorable
verse of W.S. Merwin? Most
people have never heard of them.
They are both former United
States Poet Laureates and both
winners of the Pulitzer Prize in
poetry.  Most importantly, they
are both still very much alive!
    And how about Canton’s
David Bottoms, Dalton’s Marsha
Mathews and Jasper’s own Clif-
ford Brooks, poets we’ve high-

lighted here in the Progress dur-
ing National Poetry Month; each
of them extraordinarily gifted
writers. But it is unlikely many
of us will ever read their wonder-
ful poems (although I encourage
you to, otherwise, you risk never
being exposed to something im-
portant; that is, new voices that
will reach you in new ways).
    Contemporary poets suffer
the unfortunate curse of simply
being contemporary.  They are
arguably writing poems at a time
of great historical disadvantage -
when the world is driven more
by a 24-hour news cycle than it
is by people having the time to
read great new poetry. Very few
of us have Frost or Auden or
Yeats reading their poetry on our
iTunes playlists (yes, I do).  
    The fact is that most people
remember the poetry that they
learned from either a teacher or a
parent. We grew up on the ‘clas-
sics’ - the poems that were taught
to us in high school
(Wordsworth, Tennyson,
Langston Hughes, T.S. Eliot or,
maybe, e.e. cummings); or, poets
that were read to us at a younger
age (like Shel Silverstein, Lewis
Carroll or Theodor Seuss Geisel,
better known as Dr. Seuss).
    As someone who has enjoyed
reading poetry since the age of
17, when I wrote my first poem
to my high school sweetheart
who is now my ‘wife sweetheart’
of 40 years, I find reading poetry
is as compelling (and comfort-
ing) as it has always been. Great
poetry inspires and motivates. It
communicates something that
can be communicated in no other
way.
    Seamus Heaney, the great
Irish poet and Nobel Prize win-
ner who passed away last sum-
mer, said that the poet’s words
“…stand smiling at the audi-
ence’s way of reading them and
winking back at the poet’s way
of using them.” I love that.
    However, W.H. Auden, in his
eulogy to Yeats, said that poetry
“makes nothing happen…it sur-
vives in the valley of its mak-

ing.”
    But Auden, whom I believe
was the greatest of the English
poets, was often cynical and neg-
ative about the writing of verse,
although his poetry was pro-
foundly memorable - a feast for
the mind and the heart.
    I saw Auden do a reading at
Agnes Scott College in 1971, just
two years before he died. I was a
college freshman at Georgia
State who had read his poetry be-
tween classes and even memo-
rized one of his poems (he had
influenced me, like the great
writers do, with only his words).
    To see him amble out onto
that stage in a jammed but eerily
quiet auditorium of students and
poetry lovers, his voice still
strong and his verse unforget-
table, made me realize that writ-
ing poetry was something I
would do as long as the Lord
would allow. To this day, I have
vivid memories of that night -
much like we all do of a concert
or performance that never leaves
us and serves either to confirm
our dreams or push us toward
some new direction.
    All great poetry lifts us, even
when it saddens us or inexplica-
bly takes us to place we have
never been. If we allow it to, it
helps us to see things just a little
more clearly. It connects us.
    Frost said once that “poetry
begins with a lump in the throat.”
I think he was right. 

    While the inspiration for
verse comes deeply from within,
trying to communicate through
poetry is another thing alto-
gether. It is what separates good
poets from great ones. The great
ones you keep reading over and
over.
    What makes good poetry? Is
it the sound, the rhyming, the
meter of the verse or the (differ-
ent?) messages it conveys to
each reader? Or the feeling it cre-
ates? The place it takes you? The
kinship it invites? Maybe all of
these. 
    One thing is certain - good
poetry is as highly subjective as
a good movie. Your idea of
which film should win the Oscar
will most likely be different than
mine.
    And if I say Auden or Bot-
toms or Mathews or Brooks and
you say Frost or Dickinson or
Shakespeare or Whitman, it
doesn’t really matter. Because, in
the end, the true gift of poetry is
that we can both be right.
    Dave Altman’s first book of
poetry, Death in the Foyer, is
scheduled to be published by
Finishing Line Press this Sep-
tember. Altman is the Books and
Writers Editor of the Progress.
He and his wife Lisa have a
cabin on Sassafras Mountain.

Dessert
With small hands and sticky fin-
gers, the child
Reaches upward, squealing with
anticipation,
He awaits the treat his big sister
is already enjoying.
His plastic spoon thumping the
grungy highchair, his
Words unclear but intentions un-
mistakable.
Sister, doll baby in tow, hums a
tune from pre-school
As mother sits texting and father
checks his scores.
The dog, left out again, whines
and paces
As the final bites, snatched by
tiny fingers, disappear.

- David R. Altman

David Altman

John Rosemond
Copyright 2014, John K.
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    The Wall Street Journal says
there’s no difference between a
child whose primary interest is
reading and a child who uses so-
cial media obsessively. In WSJ’s
March 22-23 “Mind and Matter”
column, Alison Gopnik recounts,
in fable form, her childhood ob-
session with “The Device,”
which turns out to be books. She
then claims to know of research
supporting the notion that read-
ing books “hijacks” large por-
tions of a child’s brain, portions
“that had originally been de-
signed for other purposes.”
    I keep up on research of this
sort, and while I can’t claim to
have seen it all, I’ve not heard of
any that compels such a conclu-
sion. The studies I’m familiar
with all support the view that the
human brain is ideally suited to
learning to read. If symbol-based
print media (i.e. books) are pre-
sented to a child at the proper
time and in the proper fashion,
the brain engages naturally and
effectively. Learning to read does
not “hijack” areas of the brain
designed for “other purposes”
(that Gopnick, most conve-
niently, never identifies). In ef-
fect, she describes the brain as a
zero-sum operating system in
which learning one skill dis-
places the ability to learn some-
thing else. That might describe a
mouse brain, but it does not
come close to describing the
amazing learning capacity of a
human’s.
    To bolster her thesis, Gopnick
cites danah boyd (boyd does not
capitalize her name) of New

York University and Microsoft
Research. Obviously, boyd is not
impartial. She works for a com-
pany that is heavily invested in
new technologies, and it’s clear
from her Wikipedia biography
that she thinks social media are
way cool. How did she come to
her conclusions? By hanging out
with teens and interviewing
them. In other words, to find out
how social media are affecting
teens, she gets social with teens.
To be clear, this is not science.
    Gopnick begins her column
by asking “How does technology
re-shape our children’s minds
and brains?” but never gets
around to answering the ques-
tion. She delves no further into
the subject than to reference
boyd’s social work and conclu-
sion to the effect that while it re-
quires new considerations, the
new social media simply enable
teens to do what they have al-
ways done - form communities,
flirt, gossip and rebel. “The kids
are all right,” she concludes,
quoting the rock band The Who.
    No, they aren’t. The best re-
search into the effect of digital
technologies on the developing
brain has been done by psychol-

ogist Jane Healy, author of En-
dangered Minds and Failure to
Connect. Healy has found that
screen-based devices compro-
mise the integrity of the develop-
ing brain, disconnecting areas
that support important functions
such as sequential problem-solv-
ing, attention span, and verbal
reasoning - all of which are
strengthened by reading. Healy is
everything Gopnik and boyd are
not. First, she has scientific cre-
dentials. Second, she is impartial.
Third, her conclusions support
common sense.
    Speaking of the latter, all one
has to do to assess the impact of
what I prefer to call anti-social
media on teens is watch them
stand around in groups, texting
rather than conversing. Or talk to
a teen who keeps looking at her
cell phone during the “conversa-
tion,” during which she demon-
strates her mastery of two- and
three-word sentences.
    Speaking as a subscriber, the
Wall Street Journal really
dropped the ball on this one…
like…totally.
    Family psychologist John
Rosemond: www.johnrosemond.
com

    With the end of the 2014 open
enrollment period for the Afford-
able Care Act, Insurance Com-
missioner Ralph Hudgens
released data which represents
the number of Georgians who
sought health insurance coverage
through the Federal Healthcare
Marketplace.
    “Just under 150,000 individu-
als will be insured through poli-
cies purchased on the
Exchange,” Commissioner Hud-
gens said. “Many Georgians
completed the application
process by the deadline but have
yet to pay for the coverage.” 

    The Insurance Department
surveyed the five health insurers
(Alliant, Blue Cross Blue Shield,
Humana, Kaiser and Peach
State), conducting business on
the Exchange to determine how
many Georgians would be cov-
ered by the private health insur-
ance. The data revealed that as of
March 31, 2014:
    • Insurers received 221,604
applications for insurance. 
    • Premiums had only been re-
ceived for 107,581 of those poli-
cies, covering 149,465 lives. 
Approximately 104,242 of those
individuals will be insured by

policies which will receive a fed-
eral subsidy.
    In 2013, the Department esti-
mated that approximately
400,000 Georgians could lose
their current health insurance
policy because the policies failed
to meet new mandates required
by the Affordable Care Act. Al-
though Hudgens encouraged in-
surers to extend those policies
until 2016, it’s unknown how
many of the enrollees were
forced into the Exchange be-
cause of policy cancellations.
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