GOGEBIC COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018 NEW SKID STEER

BID OPENING 05/21/2018 11:00 A.M. CST

TOTALWITH | TOTAL WITH
OPTIONS OPTIONS
TOTALWITH | TOTAL WITH
COMPANY NAME MAKE/MODEL BASE BID OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3 OPTION 4 OPTION 5 OPTION 4 OPTION 5 2,3, &4 2,3,&5
NORTHLAND LAWN, 2018 JOHN DEERE $42,917.88 | $5,786.42 $902.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.607.28 $49.607.28 $43,820.86 $43,820.86
SPORT, & EQUIP 394G
FABICK 2018 CZ\:ZEP'LLAR $38,883.00 | $6,800.00 $700.00 $5,150.00 $4,464.00 $5,010.00 $55,997.00 $56,543.00 $49,197.00 $49,743.00
MILLER-BRADFORD & 2018 CASE $39,000.00 | $5,200.00 $925.00 $5,500.00 $4,900.00 $5,000.00 $55,525.00 $55,625.00 $50,325.00 $50,425.00
RISBERG, INC SR 210
ALTA EQUIPMENT 2018 GEHL $38,080.00 | $7.300.00 | $900.00 | $7.950.00 | $500000 | $500000 | $60,130.00 | $60,130.00 | $52,830.00 | $52,830.00
COMPANY R220
MCCOY 2018 JOHN DEERE $42,500.00 | $5,100.00 $700.00 $5,000.00 NO BID $4,200.00 $53,300.00 $57,500.00 $48,200.00 $52,400.00
CONSTRUCTION & 3246
FORESTRY 2018 JS:O'\('BDEERE $47,700.00 | $5,100.00 $700.00 $5,000.00 NO BID $4,200.00 $58,500-00 $62,700.00 $53.400-00 $57,600.00
3,995.00 54,685.16 52,685.16 49,985.16 47,985.16
2018 NEW HOLLAND $38,890.16 | $4,700.00 $600.00 $3, $6,500.00 $4,500.00 $ $ ¥ e
LULICH IMPLEMENT, L221-T4B $5,995.00 $56,685.16 $54,685.16 $51,985.16 $49,985.16
INC 57,337.00 55,537.00 52,637.00 50,837.00
2018 KOBOTA $41,542.00 | $4,700.00 $600.00 $3,095.00 $6,500.00 $4,700.00 $ $ $ $
SSV75PHC $5,995.00 $59,337.00 $57,537.00 $54,637.00 $52,837.00
QUALITY IEP?(;”PMENT’ 20183§2§CAT $40,872.87 | $3,684.18 $546.90 $4,959.50 NO BID $4,627.79 $50,063.45 $54,691.24 $46,379.27 $51,007.06
SWIDERSKI 2018 BOBCAT $40,796.26 | $4,510.60 $559.40 $4,959.00 $5,300.00 $3,400.00 $56,125.26 $54,225.26 $51,614.66 $49,714.66
EQUIPMENT, INC S630 SSL

At the Board's special meeting, held on Tuesday, May 22, 2018, the New Skid Steer bid was awarded to Fabick.




