
IRONWOOD READY MIX

29A AGGREGATE $40.85/ton ($29.18/cyd) $28.00/cyd

PIT LOCATION Angelo Luppino Pit

29A AGGREGATE $21.12/ton ($15.09/cyd)

PIT LOCATION

34CS AGGREGATE $40.85/ton ($29.18/cyd) $37.00/cyd

PIT LOCATION Angelo Luppino Pit

34CS AGGREGATE
$21.12/ton

($15.09/cyd)

PIT LOCATION

1/4" CHIPSTONE AGGREGATE No Bid No Bid $32.00/cyd

PIT LOCATION ­­­­­­­­ ­­­­­­­­ Angelo Luppino Pit

CST MOD $31.23/ton ($22.31/cyd) No Bid

PIT LOCATION ­­­­­­­­

CST  $50.85/ton ($36.32/cyd) No Bid

PIT LOCATION ­­­­­­­­

*Deduct $5/cyd for pick-up from 

Ironwood Ready Mix yard

NATURAL SAND & GRAVEL - Lindberg - M-95

NATURAL QUARRY STONE -Moyle - Dodgeville, MI

2017 CHIPSTONE GRAVEL

GOGEBIC COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

BID OPENING 2/22/2017 11:00 A.M. CENTRAL TIME

FAHRNER ASPHALT SEALERS

NATURAL QUARRY STONE -Moyle - Dodgeville, MI

COPPER SLAG - FAS- White Pine, MI

NATURAL QUARRY STONE -Moyle - Dodgeville, MI

COPPER SLAG - FAS- White Pine, MI


