
Total Bid Error in Bid Actual Total Bid

12" Round 15" Round 18" Round 18" Arch 24" Round 24" Arch 30" Arch Price Calculations Bid Price

P.K. Forest Farms

U.P. Concrete Pipe $10.25 $12.55 $14.75 $16.50 $19.75 $23.00 $28.50 $41,827.80

Error in line 5 (18" Round). 

Should be $1,027.50 not 

$1,032.50. Difference of 

$5.00.

$41,822.80

Contech

Paynter Equipment & 

Culvert

St. Regis Culvert, Inc.

Miller Products & 

Supply

ASDCO $9.96 $12.45 $14.94 $16.60 $19.92 $22.14 $27.67 $47,817.98

Error in line 15 (30" Arch). 

Should be $719.42 not 

$7,194.20. Difference of 

$6,474.78. 

$41,343.20

ETNA Supply

Cadillac Culvert NO BID (NO RESPONSE)

At a special meeting held Monday, May 6, 2019, the Board awarded the 2019 Culvert Bid to ASDCO.  

NO BID (NO RESPONSE)

BIDDER
Size

GOGEBIC COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2019 ALUMINIZED T2 STEEL CULVERT PIPE

BID OPENING 05/01/2019 10:00 a.m. CST

REJECTED - LATE BID

NO BID (NO RESPONSE)

NO BID (NO RESPONSE)

RESPONDED WITH "NO BID"

NO BID (NO RESPONSE)


