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Wow!  Somehow the deep snow and howling wind of our endless winter missed 
Green Bay today!  So eight of us found the sunglasses we hadn’t used for five 
months and made our way to the Hyatt Regency for a beef tips, mashed potatoes, 
green beans, and cheesecake lunch.  In attendance were Ben W., Bob R., Anne, 
Bob F., Maria, Pat, Rick, and guest Nico Jacques joining us all the way from Los 
Angeles where he is getting started on his film making career.  Good luck, Nico! 
 
In honor of the Brewers home opener, we sang “Take Me Out to the Ballgame”.  
Happy Dollars came from Bob F. (did his taxes “old school” with pen and paper), 
Rick (submitted a story to the next online edition of KIWANEWS about making 
leprechaun traps at Nicolet School), Bob R. (thankful that the horrible election ads 
will be done tomorrow), Nico (family trip to Egypt), and Pat (rode to the Phoenix 
airport in a driverless cab … no kidding, he has the video). 
 
For our meeting topic, we discussed the 2023 Kiwanis International convention 
that is being held in Minneapolis.  Dates are June 21-24 and we have a copy of the 
program in the knick knack box we keep at the Hyatt (Ole noted it’s also available 
online – click here!).  Bob F. recalled going to the first Kiwanis International 
convention held in Europe.  It was 1983 in Vienna! 
 

https://www.kiwanis.org/convention/2023-convention
https://www.kiwanis.org/convention/2023-convention


 

 
 
 

 

Important Kiwanis meeting information follows.  Our regularly scheduled April 17 
lunch meeting has been cancelled!  The Hyatt Regency has a super large 
convention of high school kids coming in that day.  So we made a new plan: 
 
Wednesday, April 19 - social gathering at Zambaldi’s Brewery, 6:30 PM, 1649 S. 
Webster Avenue.  We’ll order pizza, enjoy their flavorsome beers, and … if the 
weather cooperates … dine on the outdoor patio so we can bring our dogs!  Leo 
and Thea are already excited and practicing their begging faces.  Please join your 
fellow Kiwanians on this special night! 
 
Other dates to add to your calendars: 
 
Monday, May 1 - regular lunch meeting at the Hyatt Regency  
Tuesday, May 30 - NEW Zoo with Nicolet School  
Monday, June 5 - regular lunch meeting at the Hyatt Regency  
 
By: Rick Satterlee 
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