2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

ROOFING CONTRACTORS
ASSOCIATION OF HAWAII

April 24, 2024 — Ewa Beach, Hawaii

2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

Mark S. Graham
N RCA Vice President, Technical Services

National Roofing Contractors Association

ROOFING CONTRAGCTORS
ASSOCIATION OF HAWAII

October 3, 2017 — Honolulu, Hawaii

NRCA update on
roofing industry technical issues

Mark S. Graham
N RCA Vice President, Technical Services

National Roofing Contractors Association

C.
>
=~

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments April 24, 2024

Today’s topics

* |-code basics
Residential versus Commercial

Residential provisions:

— Hawaii state amendments

— Honolulu county and city amendments
Commercial provisions:

— Hawaii state amendments

— Honolulu county and city amendments

2018 I-codes
Questions and answers

E E E

2018 MRSk

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii 2



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

IRC

A Member of the International Code Family

INTERNATIONAL

ERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIC

International Residential Code,
2018 Edition

RESIDENTIAL CODE' for One- and Two-Family Dwellings

2

] R101.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to the
construction, alferation, movement, enlargement, replace-
ment, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location,
removal and demolition of detached one- and two-family
dwellings and fownhouses not more than three stories above
grade plane in height with a separate means of egress and
their accessory structures not more than three stories above
grade plane in height.

Exception: The following shall be permitted to be con-
structed in accordance with this code where provided with
a residential fire sprinkler system complying with Section
P2904:

.
. Owner-occupied lodging houses with five or fewer
. A care facility with five or fewer persons receiving
. A care facility with five or fewer persons receiving

. A care facility for five or fewer persons receiving

Live/work units located in fownhouses and comply-
ing with the requirements of Section 419 of the
International Building Code.

guestrooms.
custodial care within a dwelling unit.
medical care within a dwelling unit.

care that are within a single-family dwelling.

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

2016 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL GODE®

NTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL Jgs




2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

International Building Code,
2018 Edition

INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE

NTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIC

CHAPTER 1
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

User nates:

About this chapter: Ghapter 1 estabishes the iimis of appiicabilty of the code and describes how the code is to be appled and enforced.
Chapter 1 is i two parts: Part 1—Scope and Appication (Seetons 101-102) and Part 2—Administation and Enforcement (Secfions 103

[A] 101.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to
the construction, alteration, relocation, enlargement, replace-
ment, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, main-
tenance, removal and demolition of every building or
structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to such
buildings or structures.

Exception: Detached one- and two-family dwellings and
townhouses not more than three sfories above grade plane
in height with a separate means of egress, and their acces-
sory structures not more than three stories above grade
plane in height, shall comply with this code or the Interna-
tional Residential Code.

[A] 101.2.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices
shall not apply unless specifically adopted.

April 24, 2024

responders du
[A] 1014 Referenced co 2
tions 101,41 through 10 in
this code shall be considered to be part of the requirements of
ibed extent of each such reference

[4] 10141 Gas, The provisions of the Inter
Gas Code shall apply to the installation of ga
the point of delivery. gas appliances and o

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING GODE®

NTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCI

Tures.

[A] 101.4.5 Fire prevention. The provisions of

national Fire Code shall apply 1o matters

relating 10 structures, processes and prem
ad

or public welfare in the
< or premises: and from the con-
xtension, repair, alteration or removal of fire
suppression, auiomafic sprinkler systems and alarm sys-
tems or fire hazards in the siructure or on the premises
from cceupancy of operation

1

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii




2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments April 24, 2024

2018 I-codes are accessible online

codes.iccsafe.org

o Unlock the Complete Set of Content & Feature:
2018 |-Codes with Premium Complete

District of

2018 Inemational Existing Bt

= Menu

Q E Sign In

2018 International Residential Code (IRC) v Codes / 2018 -Codes / 2018 International Residential Code (IRC) v [=f' BAsic READ ONLY | SUBSCRIBETO PREMIUM
<
Version: Jan 2023 ~ Chapter 9 Roof Assemblies [ Ruscreen  (F) Legend
CONTENTS ) NoTES &) INSIGHTS SECTION R901
v Chapter 9 Roof Assemblies = GENERAL®
> Section R901 General

R901.1 Scope.

> Section R902 Fire Classification
The provisions of this chapter shall govern the design, materials, construction and quality of roof assemblies
> Section R903 Weather Protection
> Section R904 Materials SECTION R902
> Section R905 Requirements for Roof Coverings FIRE CLASSIFICATION
> Section R906 Roof Insulation
R902.1 Roofing covering materials.
Section R907 Rooftop-Mounted Photovoltaic
> Panel Systems Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth in Sections R904 and R905. Class A, B or C roofing shall be installed in jurisdictions
designated by law as requiring their use or where the edge of the roof is less than 3 feet (914 mm) from a lot line. Class A, B and C roofing
> SEEimEE iy required by this section to be listed shall be tested in accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E108,
> Chapter 10 Chimneys and Fireplaces Exceptions:
> PartIV—Energy Conservation 1. Class A roof assemblies include those with coverings of brick, masonry and exposed concrete roof deck.
2. Class A roof assemblies include ferrous or copper shingles or sheets, metal sheets and shingles, clay or concrete roof tile, or °
. G 1 [ ey i) slate installed on noncombustible decks
> Part V—Mechanical 3. Class A roof assemblies include minimum 16 ounces per square foot copper sheets installed over combustible decks.

IS

Class A roof assemblies include slate installed over underlayment over combustible decks.

v

Chapter 12 Mechanical Administration

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii 5



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

Purchase hardcopy or PDF versions of the Code

codes.iccsafe.org

INTERNATIONA
COUNG:

FORMAT

srabic

PUBLISHER

Buiding - Cormmercil

Buiding - Residential

CodeMaster - Sei
(202118C and ASCE 7-16)

esign

2018 International Residential

MASS TIMBER BULDINGS AND

2018 International Fire C:

2018 18G8 Code and
Commentary Combo,

2018 International Building
Codes

Vol.1

11

ERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL [ s

CHAPTER 9
ROOF ASSEMBLIES

User note:

M R e i e i A i R e ARG e e i
s coverings:

vopor el and ol covering This capter proides th reuement o d
Chapter:

sy and concret
nd shgies, g ook, metal octpaneis, mecifed bomen

liquid applied

rooiing. roofing.
Goapter 9 aioa o L'uvmts e ements 3 ool Sranoge, oshig, sbove-deck el talsbon, rouopmecriod photovatas alems sl

recovering o replacing an exiséng rool covering

SECTION Re01
GENERAL
R901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapier shall gover the

design, materials, construction and quality of Foof ascem!

SECTION R0z
FIRE CLASSIFIGATION
R902.1 Roofing covering materiaks. Roofs shall be covered
with matcrials as sct forth in Sections RO04 and R90S. Class
A. B orC rofi

than 3 feet (914 mm) from a lot linc. Class A, B and C
roofing required by this section Lo be listed shall be tested in
accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E108.
Exception
1. Class A roof assemblics include those with coverings
of brick, maconry and exposed concrete roof deck

2. Class A roof assemblics include fermous or copper shin-
s or sheets, metal shects and shingles, clay or cancretce
roof ik, or slaie installed on nancombustible decks.

Class A roof asscmblics include minimum 16
aunces per square foot copper sheets installed over
combustible decks.

Chom Ak el il e i
underlayment over combustible

R902.2 Fire-retardant-treated shingles and shakes. Firc-
retardant-treaicd wood shakes and shingles shall be treated by
ation with chemicals by the full-cell vacuum-pressurc
in accordance with AWPA C1. Each bundle shall be
marked to identify the manufactured unit and the manufac-
e el B el e A
material in accordance with the equired in Section
company and e i i ey,

RH23 Buiding-integrated photovoltaic product. Build-

ted photovoltaic products installed as the roof cov-
ctng chal b ol e
in accordance with Section

R9024 Rooftwop-mounted phum\uh ic panel systems.
Rooftop-mounted photavoltaic panal sysiems installed on or

2018 NTEFRATIONAL RESIDETIAL CODE"

A ok g Al e s i i
with a fire classification in accondanc
2703. Class A. B o Lpl\arowmmlcpmai;‘_mm_ py
ules shall be fnstalled in jursdictions designated by law @
requiring their use or where the edge of the roof is less than 3
fect (914 mm) from a lot linc.

SECTION R903
WEATHER PROTECTION
R903.1 General. Roof decks shall be covered with approved
roof coverings scoured to the building or structure in accor-
dance with the provisions of this chapter. Roof assemblics shall
be designed and installed in accordance with this code and the
approved manufacturer's instructions such that the roefassem:-
bty shall serve to protect the building or structure.
Rw ‘_2

s shall be instlled in a manner
ents moisture from entering the wall and roof
.r.mm joints in copings, through moisture permeable mate-
rials and at intersections with parapet walls and other pencira
tions through the roof plane.
R903.2.1 Loeations. Flashings shall be installed at wall
and roof intersections, wherever there is a change in roof
sope or dirceton and sround roof openings. A flhing
shall be installed to divert the water away from whe:
eave of a sloped roof intersects a vertical sidewall. s
A oo e all ks s
a thicknss of not lcss than 0019 inch (0.5 mm) (No.
26 gabvanised sheed)
R903.2.2 Crickets and saddles. A cricket or saddle shall
be installed on the ridge side of any chimney or peneira.
tion more than 30 inches (762 mm) wide as measured per
peadicular to the slope. Cricket or saddle coverings shall
be sheet metal or of the same material as the roof covering

Exception: Unit skylights installed in accordance with
Scction R3086 and flashed in accordance with the
mamfacturer’s. insiructions sball be permited o be
installed without a cricket or saddle.

R903.3 Coping. Parapet walls shall be properly coped with
nomcombustble, weatherprool muerias of a widkh not Jes
than the thickness of the parapet wall

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

Hawaii amendments

13

€2 hawaii.gov Al Tecsze Smaller | Resst | Larger

State of Hawaii

Department of Accounting and General
Services

Ka ‘Oihana Loihelu o Lawelawe Laula

Administrative Rules  Reports ~

Home » Building Code Council » Building C:

BUILDING CODE RULES

Approved State Building Codes

e Ensrgy Code - ECC

e Fire Code - 2018 NFPA 1

Proposed Future Building Codes

P ions Relating to Affordable Hol

ereby suspend...

or Maps for use wit

d Topographic Fa

Form for Public Propo

0 Amend the Hav te Building Codes

Engiish MEE Chuukess OleloHawaii liokano EF# #20| 5 Marshaless Samoan Espaiiol Tagakog munlna TidngViét Visayan

Comptroller’s Memoranda

Work on amending and adopting any and all future editions of building codes has been suspended, as required by the G

fon, repoir, renovation, and occupancy of housing ond infrostructure p

he extent necessory 1o

owe for cansi

jects intended

Link

14

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments April 24, 2024

Hawaii amendments to IRC 2018

15

Curt T Otagure
Compireller
AUDREY HIDANO

Deputy Comptroller

DAVID Y. IGE
'GOVERNOR

JOSH GREEN
L1 cavemscR

STATE OF HAWAII
DEPARTMENT OF ACCOUNTING AND GENERAL SERVICES
STATE BUILDING CODE COUNCIL

P.0.BOX 119, HONOLULLL HAWAII 968100118

November 17, 2020

SUBJECT:  State Residential Code Adoption
Adopting the 2018 Intemational Residential Code with A

The attached document is the Hawaii State Residential Code as adopted on November 17, 2020
by the State Building Code Council in accordance with HRS 107-24.

No later than November 17, 2021, the design of all State building construction must comply with
the attached code in accordance with HRS 107-27.

No later than November 17, 2022, each county in the State of Hawaii must amend and adopt the
attached code in accordance with HRS 107-28(a).

If by November 17, 2022, a county does not amend the attached code, it shall become applicable
as an interim county building code in accordance with HRS 107-28(b).

State Building Code Couneil

Attached: Hawaii State Residential Code

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii 8



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

Hawaii amendments to IECC 2018 — Residential Provisions

17

DAVID Y. IGE Curt T. Otaguro
SOVERNOR Comptrolier
woREY WEANO

JOSH GREEN
+ oo B Deputy Comptroller

STATE OF HAWAII
DEPARTMENT OF ACCOUNTING AND GENERAL SERVICES
STATE BUILDING CODE COUNCIL

P0.BOX 112, HONOLULUL HAWAI 988700118

January 14, 2021

SUBJECT State Energy Code Adoption
Adopting the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) and
Amendments

The attached document is the Hawai'i State Energy Code Amendments to the 2018 [ECC as
adopted on December 15, 2020 by the State Building Code Council in accordance with HRS
107-24.

No later than December 15, 2021, the design of all State building construction must comply with
the 2018 IECC and attached amendments to the code, in accordance with HRS 107-27

No later than December 15, 2022
2018 IECC and attached amendn

each county in the State of Hawai‘i must amend and adopt the
nts to the code. in accordance with HRS 107-28(a).

If by December 15, 2022, a county does not amend the 2018 IECC and attached amendments, it
shall become applicable as an interim county energy code, in accordance with HRS 107-28(b).

State Building Code Council

Attached: Hawai'i State Energy Code Amendments to the 2018 IECC

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii




2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

INTERNATIONAL

NA CODE COUNCIL

RESIDENTIAL CODE’ for One- and Two-Family Dwelling

International Residential Code,
2018 Edition

19
International Energy Conservation Code,
2018 Edition (Residential Provisions)
INTERNATIONAL
ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE"
20

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

10



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

Hawaii amendments to IBC 2018

21

Deputy Comptroller

STATE OF HAWAII
DEPARTMENT OF ACCOUNTING AND GENERAL SERVICES
STATE BUILDING CODE COUNCIL

April 20,2021
SUBJECT:  State Building Code Adoption
Adopting the 2018 International Building Code with Amendments
The attached document is the Hawaii State Building Code as adopted on April 20, 2021 by the
State Building Code Council in accordance with HRS 107-24.

No later than April 20, 2022, the design of all State building construction must comply with the
attached code in accordance with HRS 107-27

No later than April 20, 2023, each county in the State of Hawaii must amend and adopt the
attached code in accordance with HRS 107-28(a)

If by April 20, 2023, a county docs not amend the attached code, it shall become applicable as an
interim county building code in accordance with HRS 107-28(b).

State Building Code Council

Attached: Hawaii State Building Code

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

11



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

Hawaii amendments to IECC 2018 — Commercial Provisions

23

DAVID Y. IGE Cur T. Otaguro
e en Compiraller

JOSH GREEN

Deputy Gomptroter

STATE OF HAWAII

DEPARTMENT OF ACCOUNTING AND GENERAL Sd}VICES
STATE BUILDING CODE COUNCIL

P.0.BOX 115, HONGLULL HABA

January 14,2021

SUBJECT:  State Energy Code Adoption
Adopting the 2018 Intemational Ene
Amendments

Conservation Cede (IECC) and

The attached document is the Hawai'i State Energy Code Amendments to the 2018 IECC as
adopted on December 15, 2020 by the State Building Code Council in accordance with HRS
107-24

No later than December 15, 2021, the design of all State building construction must comply with
the 2018 IECC and attached amendments to the code, in accordance with HRS 107-27.

No later than December -ach county in the State of Hawai'i must amend and adopt the
2018 IECC and attached amendments to the code, in accordance with HRS 107-28(a).

If by December 15, 2022, a county does not amend the 2018 IECC and attached amendmes
shall become applicable as an interim county code, in accordance with HRS 107

State Building Code Council

Atached: Hawai'i State Energy Code Amendments to the 2018 IECC

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

12



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

ENATIONAL CODE COUNCIC

International Building Code,
2018 Edition

25

IECC

A Member of the International Coda Family

INTERNATIONAL
ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE"

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

International Energy Conservation Code,
2018 Edition (Residential Provisions)

26

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

13



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

Honolulu amendments
Ordinance 23-25

27

: 23-23
CITY COUNCIL oroMANcE_ #9777
CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU B dp0amcny

A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

RELATING TC THE ADOPTION OF THE HAWAI'| STATE ENERGY CODE

BE IT ORDAINED by the People of the City and County of Honolulu:

SECTION 1. Purpose. The purpose of this ordinance is to update the Building
Energy Conservation Code of the City and County of Honolulu through the adoption of
the Hawai'i State Energy Code (December 15, 2020), subject to the local amendments
herein

SECTION 2. Chapter 168, Revised Ordinances of Honolulu 2021 (*Building
Energy Conservation Code"), is repealed.

SECTION 3. The Revised Ordinances of Honolulu 2021 is amended by adding a
new Chapter 168 to read as follows:

"CHAPTER 16B: BUILDING ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE
ARTICLE 1: BUILDING ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE
§16B-1.1 Adoption of the State Energy Code.

The Hawai'i State Energy Code (SEC), as adopled by the State of Hawaii on
December 15, 2020, which adopts, with modifications, the International Energy
Conservation Code, 2018 edition (IECG), as copyrighted by the Intemational Code
Coundil, is adopted by reference and made a part hereof, subject to the following
amendments, which, unless stated otherwise, are in the form of amendments to the
IECC 2018 edition
(1) Amending Section C101.1. Section C101.1 is amended lo read

C101.1 Title.

This code shall be known as the Building Energy Conservation Code (BECC) of

the City and County of Honolulu (CCH) or the CCH BECC. Itis referred to herein
as “this code.”

Amending Section C101.3. Section C101.3 is amended to read

C101.3 Intent. This chapter sets forth minimum requirements for the design and
construction of buildings for the effective use of energy and is intended to provide

0C82023-0690/7/26/2023 9:53 AM

23-235

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

14



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE’ for One- and Two-Family

NTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCI

International Residential Code,
2018 Edition

29
AN International Building Code,
2018 Edition
INTERNATIONA
BUILDING ¢
30

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

15



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

IECC

A Member of the International Coda Family

INTERNATIONAL
ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE"

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

International Energy Conservation Code,
2018 Edition (Residential Provisions)

31
Keeping an eye on
I-CODES:
\ Part one
""" Professional Roofing
Dec. 2017 and Jan. 2018
32

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

16



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

April 24, 2024

Some tips on wind design

33

ASCE Hazard Tool

ascehazardtool.org

ASCE HAZARD TOOL

© Enter Structure Information
@ EnterLocation ® [ ] Snap to Address

ADDRESS LAT/LONG FIND ON MAP

91-1111 Geiger Rd, Ewa Bei X W

B Standard Version €
gy NEW! ASCE/SEI 41 now
ASCE/SEI 7-16 ettt

A Risk Category © & Ste Soil Class @

" Select Soil Class

@ Customary Os
W Load Typ

L O seismi
Ote [m]

O rai 0r
a

VIEW RESULTS

Al data are per the requirements of published ASCE

‘standards; local requirements may vary

ASCEOO®

City and County of Honolulu, Esri, HERE, G:

aaaaaa

usGs, EPA, uspa (=111

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

17



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments

ASCE HAZARD TOOL

Location
91-1111 Geiger Rd, Ewa Beach, Hawail, 96706

ft with respect to Nor can
Elevation
Vertical Datum of 1988 (NAVD

Lat 2132043

Long

Standard:  ASCE/SEI

Risk

Categary

Wind a»

. DETAILS
al Wind Region - See Details

FULL REPORT SUMMARY

Al dta are per the requirements of published ASCE
standards; local requirements may vary

ASCEOO®

©2024

35

=z

Wi et;
Wind Speed 131 Venph
10-year MRI 53 Vmph
25year MR 59 Vmph
S0year MRI 67 Vmph
100-year MRI 86 Vmph
Special

Special Wind Region — Mountainous terrain, gorges, and special wind regions
shown in Fig. 26.5-1 shall be examined for unusual wind conditions. The
Authority Having Jurisdiction shall, if necessary, adjust the values given in Fig.
26.5-1 to account for higher local wind speeds. Such adjustment shall be

based on information and speed

obtained in accordance with the provisions in Section 26.5.3.

Value provided is 3-second gust wind speeds at 33 ft above ground for

Exposure C Category, based on linear interpolation between contours. Wind

speeds are interpolated in accordance with the 7-16 Standard. Wind speeds
correspond to approximately a 7% probability of exceedance in 50 years
(annual exceedance probability = 0.00143, MRI = 700 years)

Site is in a hurricane-prone reglon as defined in ASCE/SEI 716 Section 26.2.

Glazed openings need not be protected against wind-borne debris.

Data Source

-CC.24,and Section 26.52

ASCE/SEI 7-16, Fig. 26,528 and Figs

N

Measure

City and County of Honolulu, Esri, HERE, Garmin, USGS, EPA, USDA

<

=

Basemap

tdata to display

April 24, 2024

<3

Share.

Y NRCAIBReeRR

Roof Wind Designer

www.roofwinddesigner.com

WELCOME MARK GRAHAM

ROOF WIND DESIGNER

Roof Wind Designer is intended to provide users with an easy-to-use means for determining roof systems
design wind loads for many commonly encountered building types that are subject to building code

compliance.

Design-wind loads are derived using the American Society of Civil Engineers (ASCE) Standard ASCE 7,
“Minimum Design Loads for Buildings and Other Structures.” This standard is a widely recognized consensus
standard and is referenced in and serves as the technical basis for wind load determination in the
International Building Code and NFPA 5000: Building Construction and Safety Code. Roof Wind Designer
allows users to choose between ASCE 7's 2005, 2010, 2016, and 2022 editions. Roof Wind Designer uses

AsC 's Method 1—Simplified Method, ASCE 7-10's Envelope Procedure, Part 2: Low-rise Buildings
(simplified) of Chapter 30, ASCE 7-16's Envelope Procedure, Part 2: Low-rise Buildings (Simplified) of Chapter
30, and Part 4: Buildings with 60ft < h < 160ft (Simplified), and ASCE 7-22's Part 1: Low-rise Buildings, Part 2
Buildings with h > 60 ft [h > 18.3 m)], and Part 4: Building appurtenances, rooftop structures and equipment.
of ASCE 7's four editions

A more detailed

36

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii

18



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments April 24, 2024

The questions...

e The International Energy Conservation Code revised for
Honolulu took effect in November last year. What's in
there that you need to worry about?

e We get questions routinely from contractors and
manufacturer reps about when the Code applies to
residential re roofing? How about when it is with the same
material type or a different heavier material type?

e What's this about requirements when you expose
sheathing on residential reroofing jobs and needing to do
attic fans or insulation or what?

37

e When does the Code apply to commercial jobs? what is a
commercial job v. a residential job? Condos, walk up office
buildings?

e What happens if you do not follow the Code? Technically
could the owner (even if they are no longer the owner)
hold you responsible 10 years later and have you foot the
bill to do it correctly at today's cost?

e So you think you know the Code on Oahu. How about
Kauai or Maui?

38

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii 19



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments April 24, 2024

Questions... and other topics

39

Mark S. Graham
Vice President, Technical Services
National Roofing Contractors Association

10255 West Higgins Road, 600
m N RCA Rosemont, lllinois 60018-5607

(847) 299-9070
mgraham@nrca.net
www.nrca.net

Personal website: www.MarkGrahamNRCA.com

40

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii 20



2018 I-codes with Hawaii amendments April 24, 2024

Mark S. Graham

www.marksgraham.com

Home About Me News Upcoming Events Papers and Articles Links Contact

This website is intended to allow users easy access to my curriculum vitae,
news via my Twitter account, upcoming events, articles and symposium
papers, past presentations, useful links and contact information.

Additional information about my work is available on NRCA's website,

41

Roofing Contractors Association of Hawaii 21



