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Reader's question:

First of all, I request that you do not officially publish my address and the country where I 
am staying. However, I don't have anything against the publication of my name. I am of 
Jewish faith, but nevertheless I cannot cope with what my companions in faith are doing 
in Israel against the Arabs by fighting against them using the most severe terrorist acts 
and committing unrestrained killings, as it also happens on the Arabs' side against the 
Israeli people in the same way. I cannot declare myself in agreement with this and, 
therefore, I am thinking about what can be done to stop the mutual hatred between the 
two peoples and bring about peace. Could you, Mr. "Billy" Eduard A. Meier, give me 
authoritative counsel? More and more, I am frequently ashamed to be a human and a 
Jew.

Shimon Nusseibeh

Answer:

Far be it for me to occupy myself with politics, because it is not my task to be a mediator 
between peoples who want to exterminate each other out of religious or other idiotic 
reasons, and who -- in their hatred and fanaticism -- are even turning their own small 
children into killing machines; into people who do not listen to reasonable advice, and 
who would prefer to kill and to "play war" rather than to go about getting a lucrative and 
decent job. This also includes all of those armed individuals who believe they must 
defend their country and conquer it back, instead of achieving true peace and true 
freedom through reason and love, and peace and freedom in the form of a 
comprehensive and lasting coexistence that would be worthy of a human being. 
However, blinded ones, fools, idiots, killers, fanatics and those craving power, etc., can 
hardly be brought to act like this, because they don't have enough understanding to 
grasp real reason, and to recognize what is correct, to give up their high-handedness 
and lusting for power as well as their "roaring" hate and burning fanaticism, and to start 
thinking in a clear and humane way. But they cannot, because they are lacking 
intelligence to such an extent that neither a rational thought nor a reasonably resulting 
feeling may become firmly established in them. Therefore, primitivism in the word's 
most evil sense prevails, and it can never be surpassed by reason because the 
necessary intelligence is lacking. Your question regarding a good counsel (from me) 
cannot be fulfilled, because those who are not capable of rational thinking cannot be 
brought to accept rationale and logic. There is no other choice than to let all of those 
murderous and unreasonable idiots slaughter and ultimately exterminate each other, 
and it doesn't matter if they are creatures from the criminal scene or people of the 
states. They believe that they have the right to murder and commit acts of terrorism -- 
something they are calling self- or state-defense -- all of which is approved and 



supported by like-minded people or other similar groups. That's my opinion and 
experience which I have witnessed in various countries of the world and in many regions 
during revolutions and war on this wonderful world; a world that is stripped to the 
ground more and more by unreasonable, criminal, war- and revolutionary-like imbecilic 
creatures who believe that they should be paid and praised and decorated with medals 
for their actions.

I'm sorry that I cannot give you a tangible advice, because you can lead a donkey to 
water, but you can't make him drink. Moreover, he is stubborn and will be kicking and 
bucking the whole way. It is not only the Arabs and Israelis who are behaving like this, 
but also the English and the Northern Irish, the Taliban in Afghanistan, the Americans 
(who are interfering everywhere), and for quite some time NATO as well. Furthermore, it 
is also the Serbs, Albanians and Macedonians, in addition to the Iraqis and the Iranians 
and many, many others. All of the above-mentioned examples are only promoting war 
and terrorism, and not one iota of peace, love and freedom, because their inexcusable 
actions, utilized with naked and evil force, bring about new naked and evil forces, as well 
as hatred and vengeful-emotions, which then leads to new bloodshed, murder and 
manslaughter of all kinds. There is no excuse whatsoever for this, because all of it is 
totally scorning humanity and the reverence for life, and therefore everything lies 
beneath the dignity of humaneness, love, justice, freedom and peace.

Very often there exists religious and fanatical ideas, thoughts, feelings and emotions 
that lead to the mutual slaughtering, killing and terrorizing by these diverse groups, as is 
especially the case in Ireland and on the Balkans and in Afghanistan, etc. The fanaticism 
and inhumane degeneration, as a rule, is as blatant, degenerated, bestial and full of 
hate in that even innocent women and children are literally dehumanized, massacred 
and slaughtered in a murderous and agonizing way. And it is especially these innocent 
women and children who have to suffer the most because of it all, since those who are 
executing the wars and murders are completely captivated by the delusion of playing 
war, as well as by religious insanity and idleness. They prefer to kill and rape and so 
forth, rather than to work. However, this is neither an excuse for war and murder, or for 
the misuse and raping of women and children nor for torture and death penalty. There 
isn't much more to say about this, except that even the most evil predator (even if it 
falls prey to degeneration like a man-eater), doesn't kill, murder, massacre and 
slaughter life forms in such an exceptionally primitive way. A predator isn't craving for 
blood, rape and torture, and isn't full of delusion, hate and revenge when compared to 
the degenerated humans and what they are doing to their fellowmen.

Billy
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