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What is rather interesting about the Planetary Alignment of June 2, 2024, is that the 7 
Planets of the Solar System, from Earth’s Perspective will be aligned in 4 Constellations 
of the 12 Zodiacs or Mazzaroth. This makes for a 33% Factor of where the Planet 
Parade occurs. The 33 Numerical Factors speaks of the 3rd’s that are associated with 
the Age of Jesus and the Trinity among other aspects in Creation. 
 
The 4 Constellations where the Planet Parade occurs are to the Right of the Silver 
Gate, starting with Taurus, Aries, Pisces and Aquarius. The 7 Planets that are in line 
from Taurus to Aquarius, from the Silver Gate are, Venus, Jupiter, Mercury, Uranus, 
Mars, Neptune and Saturn. Obviously, the Sun is in Taurus and the Moon will traverse 
Pisces on that Day. Now, why one is highlighting the Planet Parade of June 2 in the 
Year 2024, is that it Bisects the Time-Frame from when the True Passover occurred and 
when the Acts 2 Pentecost New Wine is to occur, on July 23. 
 
A Timeline is superimposed onto the Chart of the Planetary Parade to show that the 
Alignment follows the Solar Calendar. It is such that the Equinox of March 20 is how 
many who study the End Times and Bible Prophecy assert that it should be the Correct 
determinant of when the New Year begins and when is the True Passover is derived 
from. In this case for 2024, there was a Total Solar Eclipse on April 8 that was the 3rd 
and Last of the Great American Eclipses. Some People, including oneself considers it 
an Astronomical Countdown Marker of sorts. 
 
Consider that the Day after, on April 9, 2024, is when the True Passover was to occur. If 
that be the case, based on the Solar Calendar Count, then the following is dependent 
on it. If one interprets that the ‘Morrow of the Sabbath’ is the Day after Passover itself, 
being a High Day Sabbath as described in the New Testament, then the Half-Way Time 
Marker would be May 31, 2024. This is then the Eve of the Planetary Parade when it 
reaches Maximum Alignment.  
 
What this in turn signifies is that this initial 50-Day Count corresponds to what the Jews 
call Shavuot Feast of Weeks. Then the subsequent 50 Day Count will correspond to the 
True Acts 2 Pentecost New Wine. Thus, Shavuot, on the Solar Calendar would be June 
2, approximately as there is a +/- Day Factor because the Ancient Jewish Calendar 
were initially 30-Day Months and then they alternated between 29 Days and then 30 
Days, etc. Then on the Gregorian Calendar, for example, the Month of May has 31 
Days. This should not be the case. 
 

mailto:vegapost@hotmail.com
http://www.posrscripts.org/


2 
 

At the 75th Year 
Now to the crucial Correlation of this Alternate Timeline. If the May 31-June 3 Time-
Frame is the Midpoint of the Count from the April 9 Passover, based on the Solar 
Calendar that was pegged to the Spring Equinox, then 50 Days later from the Planetary 
Alignment would by July 22. And? This is the Last Day of the Summer Wheat Harvest. 
This 2nd 50 Day Count would correspond to the Feast of the First Fruits of the Wine of 
Acts 2. 
 
In turn, this is what Acts 2 is all about and commemorates the Out-Pouring of the Holy 
Spirit into the Human Vessels that were the Disciples. Those are the ones that met in 
the House, YHVH’ House, as in the Temple Mount as was their Custom to do after the 
Resurrection of Jesus. It was at the Temple Courts that the ‘Reverse of the Curse’ 
occurred from what had corresponded at Mount Sinai on the very Day that Moses came 
down with the 2 Tablets of the Law. This is why according to this Timeline, it can never 
be the 9th of Av. 
 
Instead, Moses came down to the Israelites feasting on the New Wine Ceremony where 
they rather worshipped a Golden Calf, etc. It was at that Time and Place that 3000 
Perished. But on the Acts 2 Pentecost New Wine Feast Day, 3000 were Redeemed and 
the Birth of the Church Age occurred. Thus, this is why one believes this Planetary 
Parade is Astronomically Significant and perhaps Prophetic is that it is counting down to 
the End of the Church Age? Perhaps. One could be wrong, but it is one’s Estimation 
that it could very well be that.  
 
June 2nd is thus the First Fruits of the New Grain or Shavuot. It is also the Ascension 
Day of Jesus. It is the day that the Devil Comet 12P/Pons-Brooks is closest to the Earth 
as if to highlight the beginning of the Planetary Parade. June 2nd is the 75th Year since 
the 1st Feast of Weeks in Israel as a Nation was observed since 1948. Then the 
following Year, the Blood Moon Tetrad began on that Passover of April 13, 1949. Note 
that Abraham, the Father of the Faith, left for the Promised Land at Age 75. Will there be 
a Prophetic Parallelism to also occur at the 75th Year Anniversary of Israel and the 
Church Age? 
____________________ 
 
Chart 
 
PLANETARY PARADE - JUNE 2, 2024  
Halfway Marker to the Acts 2 New Wine Pentecost 
https://nebula.wsimg.com/b50199bd44c5e55de3c269beb82fe76d?AccessKeyId=D4010
6E1331C24ABD7C3&disposition=0&alloworigin=1  
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LEO NEW YEAR RAPTURE THEORY 
Rendezvous at the Lion's Gate 
People often say the following when asked about, ‘When is the Rapture to occur?’ They 
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say, ‘No One Knows the Day or the Hour’? Does that Verse in the Bible really pertain to 
the Rapture Timing? The purpose of this Book is to delve deep into this Question that 
has been Contemplated, Contested and Consternated for nearly 2000 Years, since the 
Church Age began or was Initiated with ‘Power from on High’ in Acts 2. One will present 
the Circumstantial Evidence of one’s Research, spanning Decades worth of Study and 
Inquiry. 
  
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1SJ0VRrzpbnjA_mlkYEbJAVw39dxHJ3Ue/view?usp=driv
e_link 
  
PENTECOST NEW WINE 
Summer White Wheat Wedding 
The purpose of this Book is to provide a Compilation of Articles over several Years of 
‘Discovery into the Journey of Identifying where and when the True Count of Leviticus 
23:15-16 occurred, i.e., the Feast of New Wine, precisely at a 99th Day Count. The 
challenge that his Book tackles is what is the Start Date? Why? This initial Start Date 
will determine the exact Day in which the Feast of New Wine, and thus the Pentecost of 
Acts 2 occurred. The Book will present Evidence that there are at least 3 main Theories 
based on differing Calendar Start Dates. 
  
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1ZuL_PpALAr9vkwTYhKYW99BwlLuaTK4y/view?usp=sh
aring 
  
CRUCIFIXION 
Circumstantial Evidence why it was in 32 AD 
When was Jesus Crucified? Was it in 30 AD? 31 AD, or 33 AD? This has been 1 of the 
most Profound Questions, that has been Debated since the Church Age started with 
Jesus' Death. Can the Year and the Week Day be Determined? Is there any Evidence to 
suggest a More Accurate Year and Week Day? The Research one is providing in this 
Book, is one's Best Attempt in Showing why one is More Convinced of a 32 AD 
Crucifixion Year. One is not attempting to ‘Convince’ , or to ‘Prove’ the Year, as that is 
beyond one’s Ability.  
  
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1e7AQ4nt0C2pqXuf4L9IXV3FBv7Aw63tw/view?usp=driv
e_link 
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