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L.E. Johnson #100 track & hardware

#200 series hardware carries 200 lb door

#125 series hardware carries 125 lb door

1.00LC

3.00 3.00

Alternate wheel positions in track for
even weight distribution.

NOTE; Track must be absolutely level
and square with jambs. Door should be
sealed on all six sides to resist
warpage.

Insert door into pocket frame and tilt
up until adjusting bolt  of tricycle
hanger will slide into seat of door
hanger plate. Lock hanger together
with lock tab.

Lift front edge of door and slide other
tricycle hanger into remaining door
hanger plate, and lock in place.

Use wrench provided to raise or lower
hanger to plumb door to jamb.

After trim stop is in place, fasten
#1550 guides as shown and adjust
until door slides smoothly and evenly
into pocket.

3/16"

Apply trim stop to frame leaving 3/16"
minimum clearance between door and
stop. Apply stop on the side of the
frame where the lock tabs are located
with screws so that the door may be
removed later if necessary.

Waterloo Mfg., Inc.
606 N. Bell Blvd. Cedar Park, Texas 78613

(512) 219-1935  fax; (512) 219-7378  e-mail: jcburch@wlmfg.com
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2-3/4" 2-3/4"

Mount door hanger plate 2-3/4" from
each edge at centerline at top of
door, with lock tabs both on same
side of door.


