
ITEM BID QTY

5/8"x7/8"x8"x72" Step Blade Grader Blade, Surface Hardened, STD 

HWY Pattern Punched
350

$104.73 $36,655.50 $103.64 $36,274.007/8”x5”x36” Top Beveled Wing Blade; Heavy Duty Carbide Inserted 

and Armored Steel Layer Welded on Surface; STD Hwy Pattern 

Punched
22

$195.00 $4,290.00 $255.00 $5,610.00 $224.16 $4,931.52 $213.46 $4,696.127/8”x5”x48” Top Beveled Wing Blade; Heavy Duty Carbide Inserted 

and Armored Steel Layer Welded on Surface; STD Hwy Pattern 

Punched 
22

$260.00 $5,720.00 $340.00 $7,480.00 $298.88 $6,575.36 $290.26 $6,385.725” Moldboard Shoes; 12” Hole Punched for Use on Front Plows and 

Wings; Approx 65° Angle from the Ground for Use with Carbide 

Cutting Edge
40

$59.50 $2,380.00 $125.00 $5,000.00 $58.10 $2,324.00 $55.55 $2,222.00

8” Moldboard Shoes; 12” Hole Punched for Use on Wings; Approx 80° 

Attach Angle
10

$79.50 $795.00 $125.00 $1,250.00 $77.36 $773.60

12" Mushroom Shoe, 6" Hole Punched, 5/8" Bolt

20 $82.00 $1,640.00 $75.65 $1,513.00 $51.74 $1,034.80

FRIEGHT CHARGE $240.00

Total Bid:

Delvery:

At its regular meeting on Monday, June 26, 2016, the Board awarded the bid to H&L Mesabi. 

$51,480.50 $19,580.00 $52,391.48

GOGEBIC COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017/2018 Winter Blade Cutting Edges Bid Tabulations

Bid Opening 06/22/2017

1:00 p.m. CST

H&L MESABI BUILT BLADES D.A. MACPHERSON

NO BID

4-5 WEEKS SEPTEMBER

NO BID

WINTER EQUIPMENT

$14,338.64

90-120 DAYS (SHOES)

NO BID

NO BID

4-5 WEEKS (BLADES)


