
FUNDRAISING 
PROGRAM

ABOUT METROPOLIS
We are a Chicago-based, 

family-owned coffee company, 
dedicated to supporting 

our friends and neighbors in 
Chicago. Our mission is to 

make a difference in people’s 
lives through coffee, and we’re 

thrilled to be a part of your 
school’s fundraising program!

HOW IT WORKS
Students pre-sell bags of coffee 
to friends, relatives, neighbors, 

etc. Once we receive your 
school’s order, we’ll roast-to-

order and deliver back to your 
school to distribute, typically 

within about 10 business days. 
Your school will receive the 

proceeds from every bag sold!

TIPS FROM THE PROS
Make a copy or take a photo 

of your order form before you 
turn it in! It’s always smart to 

have a backup.

WHAT IS THIS?BREAKFAST
BLEND
LIGHT ROAST
You’ll look forward to your 
mornings if you’re brewing this! 
Light and bright with notes of 
lemon, nougat, and pecan.

DECAF REDLINE
BLEND
LIGHT ROAST
Every bit as flavorful as its 
regular counterpart, abounding 
with rich notes of sweet caramel 
and tangerine.

SINGLE ORIGIN
ROTATING
MEDIUM ROAST
Our single origins rotate 
seasonally, to offer Metropolis 
Coffee drinkers a unique cup any 
time of the year. 

REDLINE
ESPRESSO BLEND
MEDIUM ROAST
Ride the Redline. Sweet and 
balanced with tastes of honey, 
cherry, and cocoa. Excellent as 
espresso or drip.

HURRICANE
BLEND
MEDIUM ROAST
Bold and full-bodied with just a 
hint of smoke, yet finishes tart 
and sweet like a glass of limeade.

FRENCH ROAST
BLEND
DARK ROAST
Our darkest roast, a sturdy, stout 
blend with heavy smoke and 
tobacco flavors that love milk.

Access order form 
using QR code




