GOGEBIC COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2019 GRADER, UNDERBODY, & SIDEPLOW BLADES (CUTTING EDGES)
BID OPENING: FRIDAY, MARCH 22, 2019 11:00 A.M CST

BRUEK RUSTIN
WINTER EQUIPMENT HEIGHTS TRUCK McCoY ROLAND MACHINERY H&L MESABI SUPPLY & BUILT SCHULTS GRAY IRON
COMPANY, INC EQUIPMENT CONSTRUCTION & COMPANY EAInD BLADES EQUIP EALINDRY
UNIT  TOTAL UNIT  TOTAL UNIT  TOTAL UNIT  TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION BID QNTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE  PRICE | PRICE PRICE | PRICE PRICE | PRICE PRICE
5/8”x7/8"x8"x72” Step Blade Grader Blade; Surface Hardened; 400
STD Hwy Pattern Punched, 5/8" Bolt $135.32 $54,128.00 NO BID $128.52  $51,408.00] $131.00 $52,400.00]  $126.96 $50,784.00
5/87x7/8"x8"x84” Step Blade Grader Blade; Surface Hardened; 150
STD Hwy Pattern Punched, 5/8" Bolt $157.87 $23,680.50 NO BID $149.75  $22,462.50] $151.50 $22,725.00] $148.10 $22,215.00
Inserted and Armored Steel Layer Welded on Surface; STD Hwy 90
Pattern Punched $204.06 $18,365.40]  $181.62 $16,345.80] $193.24  $17,391.60] $388.00 $34,920.00]  $361.00 $32,490.00
7/8"x5"x48” Top Beveled Wing Blade; Heavy Duty Carbide
Inserted and Armored Steel Layer Welded on Surface; STD Hwy % $272.07 $24,486.30]  $241.89 $21,770.10] $257.26  $23,153.40| $498.00 $44,820.00]  $465.00 $41,850.00
1”x8”x60” Wing Blade; Surface Hardened; STD Hwy Pattern 10 g g g g
Punched $130.48 $1,304.80] $116.75 $1,167.50] $123.97  $1,239.70] $105.00 $1,050.00] $103.34 $1,033.40
17x8”x72” Wing Blade; Surface Hardened; STD Hwy Pattern 10 B B B B
Punched $156.58 $1,565.80] $139.36 $1,393.60] $148.54  $1,485.40] $124.50 $1,245.00]  $124.01 $1,240.10
5” Moldboard Shoes; 12” Hole Punched for Use on Front Plows I I I I
and Wings; Approx 65° Angle from the Ground for Use with 40 $135.14 $5,405.60|  $55.76 $2,230.40|  $48.07  $1,922.80|  $52.00 $2,080.00|  $58.38 $2,335.20 D D D D
Approx 80° Attach Angle from the Ground for Use with Carbide 10
Cutting Edge $153.51 $1,535.10 NO BID NO BID $70.50 $705.00f  $78.88 $788.80
12” Mushroom Shoes, 6” Hole Punched, 5/8” Bolt 20 $157.85 $3,157.00]  $71.67 $1,433.40]  $61.46  $1,220.20]  $79.00 $1,580.00]  $85.25 $1,705.00
FRIEGHT CHARGE $450.00
totaLBiD PRICE|  $133,628.50 $44,340.80 $120,292.60 $161,975.00 $154,441.50

DELIVERY

4 WEEKS ARO - 6', 7', 3', 4'

3 WEEKS ARO - 5' & 6' WINGS

IN STOCK - SHOES

3-4 WEEKS ARO

3 WEEKS

3-4 WEEKS




